Purchase and Sale Agreement for Massachusetts Real Estate

If premises are residential property constructed prior to 1978 buyer must sign lead paint "Property Transfer
Notification Certification" prior to signing Purchase and Sale Agreement.

SECTION 1 -- INFORMATION AND DEFINITIONS

1.1 DATE OF THIS AGREEMENT: gM 1%, 2012

1.2 PREMISES:
City or Town: Great Barrington Land Area: 18,990 sq. ft. +/-

Street Address: 20 Castie Street, Great Barrington, MA

Seller’s Title Reference:  Book 417, Page 227 (See Rider “A” attached)

Assessor's Map Reference: Map 19, Lot 87
1.3 SELLER: THE TOWN OF GREAT BARRINGTON, by and through its Board of
Selectmen

Address: 334 Main Street, Great Barrington, MA 01230
Phone: (413)528-1619
Seller's Attorney: Kopelman and Paige, P.C. Phone: (617)556-0007
Fax: (617)654-1735
Address: 101 Arch Street, Boston, MA 02110
1.4 BUYER: 20 CASTLE STREET, LLC
Address: c/o McCormick Murtagh & Marcus
Phone: (413)528-0630
Buyer's Attorney:  McCormick Murtagh & Marcus  Phone: (413)528-0630
Fax: (413)528-5287
Address: 390 Main Street, Great Barrington, MA 01230
1.5 PURCHASE PRICE: $ 50,000.00
Paid as follows: Deposit paid this date: (to be held by Escrow Agent) $  2,500.00

Balance of Purchase Price due on Closing Date : $ 47,500.00



1.6 ESCROW AGENT: Treasurer, Town of Great Barrington
Address: 344 Main Street, Great Barrington, MA 01230
Deposits to be held in: (check one)
( X') non-interest bearing account
(__) insured interest bearing bank account
(__) other interest bearing account
1.7 CLOSING:
DATE: Within 65 days of execution of Purchase & Sale Agreement TIME: 2:00pm
PLACE: McCormick Murtagh & Marcus
390 Main Street
Great Barrington, MA 01230
1.8 INCLUDED ITEMS: the following items are included in the sale of the Premises in addition

to those generally listed below in Paragraph 2.2 of this Agreement: See Rider “C”

1.9 EXCLUDED ITEMS: The following items are exciuded from the sale and will be removed
by Seller prior to the Time of Closing:  See Rider “C”

1.10 TITLE: The Seller's deed will be a quitclaim deed unless otherwise specified here:
1.11 OTHER MATTERS: In addition to the matters set forth in Paragraph 2.4 of this

Agreement, the Premises shall be conveyed subject to the following matters (include here
subdivision restrictions, rights of way over the Premises, etc. agreed to by Buyer):

and together with the benefit of the following matters:

1.12 SELLER'S FIRE AND EXTENDED COVERAGE INSURANCE : as currently insured



1.13 ITEMS TO BE APPORTIONED AS OF DATE OF CLOSING:

___X____ Current real estate taxes
Fuei value
Water rates
Sewer use charges
Collected rents
Uncollected rents if and when collected by either party
Other:

In accordance with G.L. c. 44, 863A, Buyer shall deliver to Seller a pro forma tax payment for
fiscal year 2012.

1.14 BUYER'S MORTGAGE CONTINGENCY: N/A

1.15 BUYER' S INSPECTION CONTINGENCY DATE: (as described in Paragraph 2.21 of this
Agreement) Inspection to occur within 60 days of execution of Purchase and Sale Agreement,
For specific inspection items, please see attached Rider B.

1.16 BROKER: NONE, but refer to Rider D.

1.17 WARRANTIES - The following representations and warranties are made by Seller as of
the Date of this Agreement and also as of the time of the delivery of the deed (modify as
appropriate);

a. Seller owns the personal property described in Paragraphs 1.8 and 2.2 free of any lien or
encumbrance;

b. To the best of Seller's knowledge, information and belief, the Premises do not contain any
urea formaldehyde foam insulation (UFFI), asbestos, lead paint or unsafe concentrations of
radon gas or underground storage tanks exceeding the scope and/or estimated cost set forth in
the reports included in the Seller’'s RFP dated August 16, 2010;

¢. The building on the Premises is situated entirely within the boundaries thereof.

d. Other : N/A

UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED, THE FOLLOWING PROVISIONS SHALL APPLY:



SECTION 2 -- GENERAL PROVISIONS

2.1 Seller agrees to sell and Buyer agrees to buy the Premises upon the terms hereinafter set
forth.

2.2 Included in the premises to be sold, unless excluded by Paragraph 1.9, are the buildings,
structures and improvements now thereon, the fixtures and attached personal property used in
connection therewith including, if any, chandeliers, electric and other lighting fixtures, stair
carpets and wall to wall carpeting, Venetian blinds, window shades, curtain rods, screens,
screen doors, storm windows and doors, awnings, shutters, furnaces, heaters, heating
equipment, stoves, ranges, oil and gas burners, hot water heaters, plumbing and bathroom
fixtures, mantelpieces, outside felevision antennae, satellite dishes, fences, gates, trees, shrubs,
plants, ventilators, garbage disposers, dishwashers, washing machines, dryers, burglar and fire
alarm systems, and if built in, cabinets, shelving, bookcases and air conditioning equipment.

Seller shall at the closing deliver to Buyer all existing keys to the premises, garage door openers
and all security codes.

2.3 The deed and other documents required by this Agreement are to be delivered and the
balance of the Purchase Price paid at the Date and Time of Closing and at the Place of Closing.
Unless the Closing takes place at the appropriate Registry of Deeds, ali documents and funds
are to be delivered in escrow subject to prompt rundown of title and recording, which term shall
include registration in the case of registered land. Unless otherwise agreed, Seller's attorney
may disburse the funds if no report has been received by 5:00 p.m. of the next business day
following the date of the delivery of the deed that the documents have not been recorded, due
to some problem beyond the recording attorney's control.

2.4 The Premises shall be conveyed on the Date and Time of Closing at the Place of Closing by
a good and sufficient deed (accompanied by a Certificate of Title if this is registered) running to
Buyer (or Buyer's Nominee) conveying a good and clear record and marketable title thereto free
from all encumbrances except those listed in Paragraph 1.11 and the following:

a. Real Estate Taxes assessed or to be assessed on the Premises to the extent that such taxes
then are not yet due and payable.

b. Betterment assessments, if any, which are not a recorded lien on the Premises as of the Date
of this Agreement.

¢. Federal, state and local laws, ordinances, by-laws, regulations and rules regulating the use of
land, particularly environmental, building code, zoning, health, safety, rent control and
condominium conversion laws, if any, applicable as of the Date of this Agreement, provided that
at the Date and Time of closing the Premises may be used for existing uses. The Great
Barrington Building Inspector has inspected the Premises and prepared a report on code
compliance matters, a copy of which is attached hereto as Exhibit 1. Seller represents that the



Great Barrington Building Inspector has determined that, provided there are no substantive
changes in the condition of the building that would constitute a deterioration in its condition as
it exists on the date of this Agreement, he does not intend to issue a condemnation order for
the building under the State Building Code, nor a notice for violation of safety or Buiiding Code
provisions;

d. Existing rights, if any, in party or partition walls; and

e. Rights of ways, easements and utility easements which do not materially affect the Buyer's
use;

f. Such real estate taxes as are required to be paid pursuant to Paragraph 1.13.

2.5 Buyer may require the conveyance to be made to another person, persons or entity
("Nominee”), upon notification in writing delivered to Seller at least five days prior to the Date
of Closing.

2.6 Simultaneously with the delivery of the deed, Seller shall execute and deliver:

a. Affidavits and indemnities with respect to parties in possession and mechanic’s liens to
induce Buyer's title insurance company to issue lender’s and owner’s policies of title insurance
without exception for those matters;

b. A bill of sale for all personal property included as part of the sale, if requested by the Buyer.

¢. In the case of new construction a Certificate of Occupancy and an assignment of any and all
builder’s, seller’s or manufacturer’s warranties on the Premises or on any appliances or other
property included in the sale. N/A

d. An affidavit, satisfying the requirements of Section 1445 of the Internat Revenue Code and
regulations issued thereunder, which states, under penalty of perjury, the Seller’'s United States
taxpayer identification number, that the Seller is not a foreign person, and the Seller’s address
(the 1445 Affidavit");

e. Internal Revenue Service Form W-8 or Form W-9, as applicable, with Seller's tax
identification number, and an affidavit furnishing the information required for the filing of Form
1099S with the Internal Revenue Services and stating Seller is not subject to back-up
withholding;

f. Any plan not previously recorded, referred to in the deed.
2.7 THE BALANCE OF THE PURCHASE PRICE SHALL BE PAID BY BUYER UPON DELIVERY OF

THE DEED BY A CERTIFIED CHECK, TREASURER'S CHECK, CASHIER'S CHECK (IN EACH CASE
DRAWN ON A MASSACHUSETTS BANK OR CREDIT UNION) OR BY FEDERAL FUNDS WIRE



TRANSFER. IT IS BUYER'S OBLIGATION TO INSURE THAT BUYER'’S LENDER FURNISHES ANY
FUNDS TO BE PROVIDED BY SUCH LENDER IN COMPLIANCE WITH THIS PARAGRAPH.

2.8 The deposits made hereunder shall be held in escrow by the Great Barrington Town
Treasurer, subject to the terms of this Agreement and shall be duly accounted for at the time
for performance of this Agreement. The deposits may not be released from escrow without the
assent of both Buyer and Seller. The recording of the deed to the Premises shall constitute such
assent. In the event of any disagreement the Escrow Agent may retain the deposits pending
written instructions by both the Seller and Buyer, or an order of a court of competent
jurisdiction. So long as Escrow Agent serves in good faith, Buyer agrees to hold harmless
Escrow Agent from damages, losses or expenses, arising out of this Agreement or any action or
failure to act, including reasonable attorney’s fees, related thereto.

2.9 Full possession of the Premises free of all tenants and occupants shall be delivered at the
Date and Time of Closing. The Premises then shall (a) not be in violation of any of the matters
in Paragraph 2.4.c or of the provisions of any matter or instrument referred to in Paragraph
1.11; (b) be free of encroachments burdening the Premises and of improvements which
encroach on adjoining property, including buildings, septic system, well and driveway; and, (c)
have sufficient legal access to a public way. Otherwise, except as provided herein, the Premises
are being sold “as is.” From the Date of Agreement to the Closing, Seller shall maintain its
current insurance coverage on the Premises and shall reasonably maintain the Premises as
would an owner under similar circumstances, but shall not be required to repair damage caused
by reasonable use or wear, except as required herein.

Upon Seller vacating, the Premises shall be in the same condition as they now are (reasonable
use or wear excepted) and broom clean and free of trash, debris and personal property not
included in the sale. Seller shall remove the so-called fire whistle air tanks/compressors located
in the basement of the buiiding.

2.10 Seller may, if Seller so desires, at the Closing, use all or part of the Purchase Price to clear
the title of any encumbrances or interests provided that ail instruments necessary for this
purpose are recorded by and at the expense of Seller simultaneously with the deed or at such
later time as shall be reasonably acceptable to Buyer, and provided further, with respect to
discharges of mortgages from insurance companies, banks and credit unions, such discharges
may be recorded within a reasonable time after the recording of the deed.

Failure by the BUYER to notify SELLER of any title objections within thirty days after the delivery
to BUYER of the survey provided for in Rider B shall be deemed a waiver of any such objection
and BUYER shall accept such title at Closing as SELLER can convey.

2.11 If Seller is unable to convey title or deliver possession of the Premises as required

hereunder or the Premises do not comply with the requirements of Paragraph 2.10, upon notice
by either party, prior to the Date of Closing, this Agreement shall be automatically extended for

6



30 days (or if Buyer's mortgage commitment sooner expires, to a date one business day before
the expiration of such commitment). Seller shall remove all mortgages, attachments and other
encumbrances incurred or assumed by Seller which secure the payment of money, provided the
total amount thereof does not exceed the Purchase Price, and Seller shall use reasonable efforts
to remove other defects in title, or to deliver possession as provided herein, or to make the
Premises conform to the provisions hereof.

At the end of the extended period, if all such defects have not been removed, or the Seller is
unable to deliver possession, or the Premises do not conform with the requirements of this
Agreement, Buyer may elect to terminate this Agreement and to receive back all deposits, upon
receipt of which all obligations of the parties hereto shall cease.

At the original or extended time for performance, Buyer may elect to proceed with the Closing
upon payment of the full Purchase Price reduced by an amount sufficient to remove all
mortgages, attachments and other encumbrances which secure the payment of money which
have not been removed by Seller, but otherwise without deduction. In the event that the reason
the Premises do not conform is damage to the Premises caused by fire or other casualty insured
against, and Seller has not restored the Premises to their former condition and Buyer elects to
proceed, Seller shall assign all insurance proceeds to Buyer and the Purchase Price shall be
reduced by:

a. the amount of any insurance proceeds received by Seller; and
b. any deductible amount under Seller’s insurance policy.

2.12 All offers and agreements made prior to this Agreement are hereby discharged and all
further obligations of the parties are contained only in this Agreement. The acceptance of a
deed by Buyer (or Buyer’s Nominee) shall be a full performance and shall discharge every
agreement and obligation herein except any agreements which by their terms are to be
performed after the Closing. All representations and warranties herein shall survive the delivery
of the deed. Buyer has not relied upon the representations or warranties of Seller except as
specifically set forth in Paragraph 1.17.

2.13 If Buyer shall fail to fulfili Buyer’s part of this Agreement, all deposits made hereunder
shall be forfeited and become the property of Seller as liquidated damages, which shall
constitute Selier’s sole remedy at law or in equity for Buyer’s default under this Agreement.
Both parties specifically consent to the deposits as the acceptable measure of Seller's damages
regardiess of the amount of any subsequent sales price which Seller may receive for the
Premises.

2.14 Buyer’s designating a Nominee to take title to the Premises shall not relieve Buyer of any
obligation hereunder. Any note, mortgage ot other document to be delivered from Buyer to
Seller shall be executed by and be the personal obligation of Buyer, or be unconditionally
guaranteed by Buyer, untess otherwise specified herein.



2.15 Buyer warrants and represents that Buyer has dealt with no broker or agent with respect
to this transaction or these Premises and agrees to indemnify and hold Seller harmless from ali
claims for brokerage or commission on account of this sale by any person.

a. Seller gives Buyer prompt notice of the claim;
b. Buyer is afforded an opportunity to defend against the claim;

¢. The claimant produces evidence that claimant dealt with Buyer with respect to the Premises;
and,

2.16 If a party hereto is a corporation, no shareholder, or if a party hereto is a trust, no trustee
or beneficiary of the trust, shall be personally iiable for any obligation, express or implied,
hereunder. If Seller or Buyer discloses in this Agreement that either of them is acting in a
representative or fiduciary capacity, only the principal or estate represented shall be bound. If
more than one person is named herein as Buyer or Seller their obligations hereunder are joint
and several.

2.17 TIME IS OF THE ESSENCE OF ALL PROVISIONS OF THIS AGREEMENT.

2.18 This Agreement, including all Riders, is to be construed as a Massachusetts contract, is
binding upon and inures to the benefit of the parties hereto and their respective successors and
assigns, and may be modified or amended only by a written instrument executed by Buyer and
Selier.

2.19 Any matter or practice arising under or relating to this Agreement which is the subject of a
Title Standard or a Practice Standard of the Real Estate Bar Association for Massachusetts
(REBA) shall be governed by said Standard to the extent applicable.

2.20 Except as provided in Paragraph 2.21 all notices required or permitted to be given
hereunder shall be in writing and delivered in hand, or sent by Federal Express or other
recognized overnight delivery service, or mailed postage prepaid, by registered or certified mail,
addressed to Buyer or Seller at the appropriate address as specified in Paragraphs 1.3 and 1.4
or to such other address as shall be designated by written notice given to the other party. Any
such notice shall be deemed given when so delivered in hand or, if sent by Federal Express or
other recognized overnight delivery service, on the next business day after deposit with said
delivery service, or, if so mailed, three (3) business days after deposit with the U.S. Postal
Service.

2.21 (This Paragraph is applicable only if the Buyer's Inspection Contingency Date has been
specified in Paragraph 1.15.) See Rider “"B”



The Buyer’s obligations hereunder are contingent upon Buyer’s receipt, prior to 5:00p.m. on the
Inspection Contingency Date, of written inspection reports on the Premises satisfactory to
Buyer. Such reports may, at Buyer's option, include inspections for structural and mechanical
matters, pests, including wood-boring insects, lead paint, asbestos, UFFI, radon gas or other
hazardous substances, underground tanks, septic system and well water. Should the resuits of
any such test be unsatisfactory to Buyer, Buyer may cancel this Agreement by written notice
received by the Seller no later than 5:00 p.m. on the day after the Inspection Contingency Date,
whereupon all obligations of the parties shall cease and Buyer’s deposits shall be promptly
returned in full. Buyer’s failure to give such notice shall be a waiver of Buyer's right to cancel
under this Paragraph.

2.22 The Riders listed below and attached to this Agreement are incorporated herein by
reference:

Rider “A” — Copy of Deed
Rider “B" — Inspection Contingency
Rider “"C” — Special Conditions

Rider *D" — Real Estate Broker
Executed under seal by the Parties hereto as of the date of this Agreement.

WHEN EXECUTED, THIS WILL BE A BINDING CONTRACT AND AN ATTORNEY SHOULD BE
CONSULTED BEFORE SIGNING.

BtEEMmen

20 CASTLE STREET, LLC

TOWN OF GREAT BARRINGTON

Seller 4" T~



o T

RIDER "A"

SE22 1

FRESACHUSHTTE WARRANTY SEES B¥ coawcw.\-rrmg-ggguaéﬁjaz 7
KN OW ALL ‘M EN BY THESE PRESENTS

That, The GREAT BARRINGIOW ?;RE DISTRICT, a duly authorlzad municipal
cozporation undex 'thé laws of the Commonwealth of Massachusetts,

s ey fierdamdmpalnriaesnlx. .
of Great Barrington, parkshire County, Massachusetis
T ; dy : .

" : . for eonsiderztion peid
and in full rcomsidexation of ONE DOLLAR {$1.00)
gragt 10 m@p rNEASTTANTE OF THE TOWN OF GREAT BARRINGTOW -

= o ' with warrgniy owengnies

the Iand In &he Towh of Gfeat Barrington, Berkshire County, Massachusetts,
boundaed and described as follows: )
[ AT R BT MR K P G
iPARCEL . A cértain tradt-ar parcel of land situated in CGreat

Barringﬁon.-bauﬁdad and described_as fcllﬁws; Paginning at & set stone
which markg the southke;terly corner of land of the Great Barrington
Fire District and southeasterly cornexy of the premises hereby conveyed,
20l stone being loecated in or near the ncrth line of mald Castle Streets
thence wasterly on saild Castle gtreet $5.% faet to an iron pipe which
marks the southgasterly corner of land now op formerly .of 6. E. Nettleton;
thahce north by Iine parallel with the west line of the house locsted on
the premises hereby canveyad(an& 2 Feet distant therefrom and on the
east line of said Nettleton 14L.8 feet t& an iron pipe standing in the
gsouth line of 1and‘5cw or formerly of the George A. Stevens Lumber
Company; thence easterly on line of Land now or formerly of said George
h: 98 Stevené Tumber Company and lasd formerly of Gimlich & White to the
northvesterly corner of land of the Great Barrington Fire District;
thence souvtherly in the west liné 6f the sald Great Barringtoen Fire
District éo the place of keginning.

Belng all and the same premises as were conveved fo the Gredt

ot oo f . ) ’ . .
Baxr;ngtan Fire District by desd of Irene Carson duted Ootober LB, 1966
recordsd in the Southetn Berkshire Registry of Deeds in Bock 354, Page

252.




sioe 417 228

PARCEL 2. A certain tract Df rerogl of land sltuated on the no:ﬁhé
gide of Qastla Sﬁieah. in said Great Barwin ngton, boundbd and describad
23 follows: Beginning at an iron pin set in the ground at the noétﬁaasﬁ
corneyr of the pfemises hereby conveyad (it being suppbged Lo Ea also the
northwest corner of prémises formerly owned by Maria o, Manning) 1 thenca
south, 35% degraes'west,ua rbds and 5 mlégs o the northerly llna of
Castle Street; thence westerly along the line of sazd Castle Street ?5
feet: thenze northerly, in 2 line parallel with Lhe gasterly line, and
73 feeat Aistant therefrom, £c Iand formerly of Silans Sprague,.decaased:
thence easterly, on said Sprague 8 southerly line 75 feet o the place of
begimming. .

Keaning and xntendlng hereby to corvay a portion of the same
mramises described in a ce:tatn dﬁed from Righard H. Modre'tc Martha E,
¥orton, dated April 1, 18%5, and recorded in the Southern Berkshira
Registry of Deeds in Book 171, Page 444, The said premlses are Qaréby
canvgye@ subyact tc the reservation ang agreement in relztion to sewayr,
yﬁich are contained in zsid dead.

Baing aliugnd the dma premises as weze ﬂspvnyed to the Inhabitants

of the Great éarrlngpon Plre Umstr;c* by dead of Martha . Horton dated

id ‘Registry of Deeds in Book 180, page 31,

Wmmmw“‘w““vwwmumnﬂw

August 9, 1892, reeo crde& in
PRRCEL 3. A certain tract or pareel of land sitnated an the

acrtherly sids of Castle Street, in sald @reat Barrington, bounded and

deseribed as follows: Beginning at the northeast corser of the tracs
hereby conveved, it being 2isc tha northwest correr of other premises

N - .




T T e e T w229

convleyed by Martha B. Rortoen, ‘:;o sald inhabitants of the Great Bérri.ngton
Pi.’.’leDiStriCt: thence scuth 35% degrees west, 8 rods and § links, %o the ‘
northerly line of Czstle Street, thence westarly, along the J,:Z.nta‘ of said L
Castle Breat, & feei‘z. therce portherly, in a line pargllel'with lthe

c- B easterly J.ine alf t—.?xe‘ tract hereby conveyed, and 6 fhet dlstant therefrom,
<o) lamilformqr}.y of 8ilas Sprague, deceasad, thencs ea'starl_y on sEld
3pragus's s‘o‘ut]"\,‘erly line & feet, to the place of beginning: h.eing,a
portion of the pramisés‘dﬁs;ribad_in & certain deed from Richard H. Moore

to sald Martha E. Worton, dated april 1, 1895, and recorded in the
Southern Barkshire Registry of Deeds in Book 171, Dage 444, The said
L : Sl JSRES AR, .

C.-;

bremises are hereby conveyed subject to the reservatian and agreement

in relation to sewar, whirh are contained in said deed.

L

Being all and the same premises as were :onva;}ed to The Inhabitants

of the great Barrinuton Pire District Ly deed of Martha E. Norton, dated
Augnst 9, 1899, recorded in said Registry of Deeds in Book 178, Page 41.

This conveyance is subject to remervatrions af the Grest Barrington
Fira District to continue the uss of the sald building on the esbove described
parcels presantly being used by said Fire Distriet for water Department
purposes. Eaid use of bullding shall be without cost €5 the saig District,

Referehee is made to Article 16 of the 1976 Annual Meating of the
Great Earrington Pire District and Article 20 of the 1376 Anrual Mesting
of the Town of Great Barrington accepting Chapter 136 of the hots of 1975
authorizing the Town to take over the fire and sidewalk duties and respongi~
bilities of the Grest Barrington Fire Distrigt. -
; ‘ IN WITNEES WHERBOF, the GREAT BARRIFGTON FIRE DISTRICT has caused
its corporate seal £o be herebe affixed and thesas presents to be signed,
acknowledged and delivered in its name and behalf by Lts FPRUDENTIAL

COMMITTEE, thie J3% day of august, 1875, ‘ .
\ GREAT BARRINGTON FIRE DISTRIDT -

PRUDENTIAL COMMTTTRE

‘{.QM‘ oS Mg A0 Hgrtimer T. Cavanaugh ‘7 T
;. } Q,Q() ‘ £fzad C: ":)A-/l'»r‘u Aarbid ¢
¢ ' Robert O‘. Hamner
‘ J//««%/d B A Mo

J&hn O'Hara
Vit . 2
.:'.'w’{.r‘"-”:'ﬂ et % o
e Armand L. Febrran

Ty Commonmealth of Haganrinenerrs

Berkshire, a5 . hugust 23, 175

T B

Then personally appeared the hove named Mortimer T.Csvanaugh, Robert O, Hammer,

John B. O'Hara, and Armend L. Ferron _
wnd acknowledged the foregoing Instrament to be the free act and desd of the Creat Barrington

Fire pistrict )
: before me T 1 ' A
' @%@&%f 2

Notary Publi¢—dSnid ot dms: W
Ney r7 v/

Received Southers Berkahire Registry of Deeds Aug. 31? 1878 2% 11:02

[ a.m, ' \ " 2 . : . . .
o | gﬁm&—&rx/(,’g_ ?/J'ﬁeﬁrn_g/",fr_/ ?‘?l Register

My issinn erpises




RIDER "B”

Inspection Contingency

During the 60 day inspection contingency period:

Seller shall provide, at its expense, a satisfactory survey showing all encroachments,
easements, rights of way, etc., which shall not affect the intended use of the premises.

Seller to provide Buyer with documentation to verify that the underground oil tank was
filled in 1999 and was done so in accordance with all applicable regulatory requirements,
and that all other gas or oil tanks have been removed and that such removal was done in
accordance with all applicable regulatory requirements.

Seller grants permission to Buyer to remove portions of the brickwork for inspection
purposes during the inspection contingency period. Prior to any such removal, Buyer
shall present a written work plan for such removal to Seller for its approval, which shall
not be unreasonably withheld. Buyer shall restore said removed brickwork to the same
condition it was in at the time of removal.

Buyer shall have the right to terminate this contract during the inspection contingency
period if the structural assessments of the stability of the building and/or the estimate of
the cost of brickwork restoration make the restoration economically unfeasible. Buyer
shall provide Seller with copies of all reports, assessments, estimates and documents
prepared by or for Seller in connection with its inspection of the premises.

11



RIDER “C”

Special Conditions

The Parties acknowledge that a portion of a water main of the Great Barrington
Fire District is located underneath the Building on the Premises and that the Fire
District intends to relocate the main to the so-called alleyway on the westerly side
of the Building. It is anticipated that the relocation will take place prior to the
Closing. The Parties acknowledge that the Fire District will require an easement
for the permanent placement of the water main in the relocation area, and that
the Buyer intends to grant such an easement once it takes title to the Premises,
The Parties agree to cooperate with each other and with the Fire District in the
relocation process.

The Town of Great Barrington agrees to seek the necessary authorization and
approval, including a Town Meeting vote, for a tax increment financing (TIF)
agreement to provide for assessment of the Premises at a value of $50,000.00
during the period that the Town continues to use any portion of the Premises
pursuant to the terms of this Agreement, followed by a ten year value schedule as
follows: years 1-4 - $50,000; years 5-7 - $300,000; years 8-10- $500,000, after
which the Premises shall be assessed at their full and fair value as determined in
accordance with the requirements of the General Laws. The parties agree that
the TIF agreement shall inciude a provision that if the full and fair assessed value
of the Premises during any year of the TIF agreement is less than the value stated
in the foregoing scheduie, Buyer will have the option of paying taxes based on
such assessed value.

Buyer shall provide Seller with use and occupancy of the second floor of the
Building, for those uses currently being made thereof by Seller, for a term of up to
24 months from the date of closing, provided Seller makes entire Premises
available to Buyer for inspection purposes of Buyer's consultants and contractors
upon reasonable notice from Buyer. Seller shall have use and occupancy of the
first floor of said Building on a month to month basis. During Seller’s use and
occupancy of the Building, the following provisions shall apply:

Seiler shall maintain its current insurance coverage on the Premises, and
shall arrange for Buyer to be named as an additional insured and loss
payee. When Seller vacates any portion of the Building, the costs of such
insurance shail be pro-rated as between Buyer and Seller, based upon the
percentage area of the Building available for Seller’s use.

Seller and Buyer each agree to indemnify the other for any costs, loss or
expense incurred by the other on account of a release of hazardous

12



material caused by the act or omission of Seller or Buyer, as the case may
be.

Seller shall be responsible for all repairs and maintenance of the building
reasonably required to maintain the building in a condition similar to its
present condition so as to be suitable for Seller's use thereof and for
Buyer’s performance of the renovation and restoration contemplated by this
Agreement, but Seller shall not be responsible for repairs or maintenance
made necessary by the work of such renovation or restoration. Buyer shall
be responsible for all structural repairs, unless such repairs are made
necessary by an act of Seller in its use of the building.

Seller shall be responsible for all utilities, including but not limited to fuel,
electric, water, sewer, snow removal, lawn and grounds maintenance and
trash removal. When Seller ceases to occupy either the first floor or the
second floor, responsibility for the utilities shall be equally divided between
Seller and Buyer. If Seller ceases to occupy a portion of the Building, but
less than an entire floor, Seller’s responsibility for utilities shall be reduced
pro rata according to the area vacated, as reasonably agreed to by Buyer
and Seller, and the Buyer shall be responsible for the costs attributable to
the reduction percentage.

Buyer and its consultants and contractors shall have the right to enter the
premises, with reasonable prior notice to Seller, except in the event of an
emergency, for which Buyer may enter without notice.

Seller will provide Buyer with a 60 day notice of its intent to vacate the first
floor or the second floor, or a portion thereof.

When Seller no longer occupies any portion of the Building, Buyer shall
become responsible for insuring the Building.

Upon termination of tenancy, Seller shall leave the premises in the same
condition as at the start thereof, reasonable wear and tear excepted.

Seller and Buyer to agree upon the personal items that shall remain on the
Premises. Seller shall provide a Bill of Sale for said items at closing as provided
for in 2.6 (c) of this Agreement.

Buyer represents that it intends to develop and use the Premises in compliance
with the provisions of the Great Barrington Zoning Bylaw. The use of the Property
shall comply with all applicable laws and regulations, and approvals, licenses,
permits and variances issued by any Federal, State or Local governmental

13



authority having jurisdiction thereof. In the development of the Premises, Buyer
shall proceed in good faith, and shall keep the Seller, through its Town
Manager/Board of Selectmen, regularly informed regarding the planned and
anticipated use of the Premises.

Buyer understands and Seller acknowledges that certain environmental
remediation and removal activities will be required for development of the
Property ("Remediation Activities”). Remediation Activities shall be defined as
actions required to comply with the requirements of applicable Environmental
Laws, or orders issued thereunder by an authorized person. “Environmental
Laws” shall mean, collectively, any federal, state, or iocal iaw, rule or regulation,
code or by-law pertaining to protection of the environment or regulation of
pollution of air, water or land, and any judicial interpretation thereof, including
without limitation, the Comprehensive Environmental Response, Compensation
and Liability Act of 1980, 42 U.S.C. §§ 9601 et seq. ("CERCLA"); the Resource
Conservation and Recovery Act, 42 U.S.C. §§ 6901 et seq. ("RCRA"); the Clean
Water Act, 33 U.S.C. §§ 1251 et seq.; the Clean Air Act, 42 U.S.C. §§ 7401 et
seq.; the Massachusetts Hazardous Waste Management Act, G.L. c. 21C §§ 1 et
sed.; the Massachusetts Oil and Hazardous Material Release Prevention and
Response Act, G.L. ¢. 21E §§ 1 et seq. Environmental Laws shall not include the
Great Barrington Zoning Bylaw, the State Building Code, plumbing or electrical
codes, or, without limitation, other laws, regulations and codes applicable to
building construction and land development in general as opposed to protection
of the environment or regulation of pollution in particular.

A description of reasonably anticipated Remediation Activities is contained in
Seller’s RFP, specifically in the June 21, 2005 letter of EcoGenesis Corporation to
Steve McAlister of Clark & Green, Inc. (the “EcoGenesis Letter”). The cost of any
Remediation Activities, up to a total of $80,000 shall be borne as follows: the first
$20,000 — Buyer; the next $20,000 - Seller; the next $20,000 ~ Buyer; the next
$10,000 - Seller; the next $10,000 — Buyer. Seller shall be responsible for the
cost of any Remediation Activities in excess of said $80,000, but subject to a
maximum obligation of $220,000 and the following provisions: Seller intends to
engage an environmental consultant to determine the total estimated cost of
Remediation Activities. If Seller notifies Buyer prior to the end of the 60 day
inspection contingency period provided for in Rider B that the total estimated cost
of Remediation Activities reported to Seller by its consultant exceeds $300,000,
the parties shall have the following options: negotiation of allocation of those
costs in excess of $300,000 or a declaration by Seller, at Seller's sole discretion,
that this Agreement is void and of no further effect. In the event of such a
declaration, Buyer’s deposit shall be returned.

Buyer shall contribute $3,000 toward the cost of Seller’s environmental
consultant, either by partial payment to the consultant or delivery of funds to

14



Seller. Seller shall provide Buyer with a copy of the report of Seller’s
environmental consultant.

Notwithstanding the provisions of paragraph 2.4.c, Buyer shall not be precluded
from performing repairs to the Building, subject to the requirement of obtaining
and complying with such permits and regulatory approvals, if any, as are required
for the particular repairs; and provided, that if Buyer commences any such repairs
it shall proceed regularly, diligently and uninterruptedly to complete such repairs.

The Buyer shall execute an affidavit of compliance with the provisions of G.L.
Chapter 7, Section 401.

The Buyer shall execute, as required under G.L. Chapter 60, Section 778, an
affidavit of non-conviction of crimes relating to arson and that it is not delinquent
in the payment of any real estate taxes, or is current in a pre-existing repayment
agreement with any taxing authority, whether within the Commonwealth of
Massachusetts or elsewhere.

15



RIDER "D”

REAL ESTATE BROKER

Except as provided below, the Buyer and Seller warrant and represent to each other that
neither one has dealt with a real estate broker or agent with respect to this transaction or these
premises.

Buyer discloses and Seller acknowledges the disclosure that Buyer has communicated
with Barnbrook Realty, 271 Main Street, Great Barrington, MA (“Barnbrook”) regarding the
premises, although Buyer represents that Barnbrook did not introduce Buyer to the premises.
Nevertheless, Buyer intends to make a courtesy payment to Barnbrook upon the closing of this
transaction; and Buyer shall be solely responsible for payment of any fees or commissions to
Barnbrook.

Except with respect to Buyer’s obligations to Barnbrook, the Buyer and the Seller agree
to indemnify and hold each other harmless from any and all claims for brokerage or commission
fees on account of this transaction or these Premises by any person(s), including a real estate
broker(s) or real estate brokerage firm(s).

The Seller and the Buyer agree to the terms and conditions set forth hereinabove.

438319 v.5/GRBA/0001

16



TOWN OF GREAT BARRINGTON

MASSACHUSETTS
MEMORANDUM
TO: Kevin O’Donngll-To%mn Manager
FROM; Edwin May .5, *if

DATE: 9/22/2011_#
cory: .' .
SUBJECT: 20 CASTLE STREET — What can g0 n va. permitnﬂg rcquiz_fﬂnents?

780 CMR allows the continuation of the same “USES” as the building has lawfully been
permitted to be used. In this case a Fire Station or Business Use. Any new use suggested other
than Business, would require an evaluation of the building as per MA amended 2009 IEBC
§101.5.4.0, attached, by a licensed MA design professional.

['have included the code references for Amended 2009 IEBC §408 Historic Buildings. This
section would aliow the Architect with the Bl to ‘post’ any existing nonconforming conditions
that do not meet code. I have included the ‘commercial roofing’ citations from the 2009 IEBC to
show that even a re-roofing project could require an evaluation of the gravity loads down to the
soil supporting the existing foundation.

ELECTRIC / WIRE INSPECTOR:
See 527 CMR 12:00, MA Amendment, Rule #1, 3 and 4, attached.
Ne work performed means no work required.

PLUMBING INSPECTOR:

See 248 CMR § 10:10, 1. {table) Minimunm Facilities for Building Occupaney, attached.
Ne work performed requires no new fixtures.




Memorandum
47972000
m2of2

These inspectors are charged with inspecting work performed for hire ONLY and only when an
application has been filed in this office by a duly licensed contractor and the fee has been paid,
$44.00 / $55.00 respectfuily. Neither inspector possesses a license to design anything in a
building of this size, >35,000 cubic ft, only plan review and inspections as per the code, versus
use and occupancy. The State of Massachusetts requires 2 MA Licensed Design Professional
Architect or Engineer for that task. {780 CMR, MA Amended 2009, c.1 §107.1.1/107.6.2.1]
Either inspector may be hired as a private contractor / consultant @ $80.00-$100.00 / hr. They
would then have to recuse themselves from any inspector duties of these premises in the future.

DEPARTMENT OF ENVIROMENTAL PROTECTION:

Any selective demolition would trigger an abatement of lead and asbestos requiring a licensed
contractor, DEP permits and a MA design professional as the roof shingles, floor tiles and steam
pipes contain asbestos composite. [see 310 CMR 7.15 attached]

BOH:
Inspector’s duties include plan review and inspections for any food service, i.e. Culinary School.
The other uses are off their radar,

FIRE SERVICES:

Substantial or “Major Renovations’ as defined in 780 CMR, Amended 2009 IBC ¢. 9, §903.2 and
2009 1IEBC §102.2.1.1 /6032 trip the sprinkler requirements of the code. Early warning
notification devices, i.e. horn/strobes, manual pull siation, smoke and CO detectors and off
premises alarm noftification is all spelied out by a MA Licensed Design Professional and review!
inspected by the Fire Chief or his designee.



CHAPTER 3

USE AND OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION

SECTION 301
GENERAL

301.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shali control the
classification of all buildings and structures as to use and occu-

pancy.

SECTION 302
CLASSIFICATION

302.1 General. Structures or portions of structures shall be
classified with respect 1o cccupancy in one or more of the
groups listed below, A room or space that is intended to be
occupied at different times for different purposes shall comply
with all of the requirements that are applicabie to each of the
purposes for which the room or space will be occupied, Struc-
tures with muitiple occupancies ar uses shall comply with Sec-
tion 508, Where a strocture s proposed for a purpose that is not
specifically provided for in this code, such structure shall be
classified in the group that the vceupancy most nearly resem-
bles, according to the fire safety and relative hazard involved.

1. Assembly {see Section 303): Groups A-1, A-2, A-3,
A-d and A-5

2. Business (see Section 304} Group B
3. Bducational (sec Section 303 Group B
4. Factory and Industrial (see Section 3061 Groups F-1

and F-2

5. High Hazard {see Secdon 307): Groups H-1, H-2, H-3,
H-4 and H-3

6. Institutional (see Section 308 Groups -1, 1-2, -3 and
-4

7. Mercantile (see Section 309): Group M

8. Residential (see Section 310): Groups R-1, R-2, R-3
and R-4 '

9. Storage (see Section 311} Groups S-1 and §-2
10. Utility and Miscellancous {see Section 312} Group U

SECTION 303
ASSEMBLY GROUP A

303.1 Assembly Group A. Assembly Group A occupancy
includes, amang others, the tse of a huilding or structure, or a
portion thereof, for the gathering of persons for purposes such
as civie, sociad or religious functions; recreation, food or drink
consumption or awalting ransportation.

Exceptions:

I. A building or tenant space used for assembly pur-
poses with an occcupent foad of less than 30 persons
shall be classified as a Group B occupancy.

2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE®

2. A rcom or space used for assembly purposes with an
vecupant load of less than 50 persons and accessory
to another occupancy shall be classified as a Group B
occupancy or as part of that occupancy.

3. A roowm or space used for assembly purposes that is
less than 750 square feet (70 m?) in area and accessory
to another occupancy shall be classified as a Group B
occupancy or as part of that cccupancy.

4. Aésembly areas that are accessory o Group E occu-

. Accessory religicus educational rooms and religious

pancies are not congidered separate occupancies
except when applying the assembly occupancy
reguirements of Chapter 11.

auditoriums with occupant icads of less than 100 are |
not considered separate occupancies. :

SECTION 304
BUSINESS GROUP B8

304.1 Business Group B. Business Group B occupancy
includes, among others, the ase of a building or structure, or a
portion thereof, for office, professional or service-type transac-
tions, including storage of records and accounts. Business
occupancies shall inclhude, bt not be limited to, the following:

Airport traffic control towers
§  Ambulatory health care facilities

Amnimal hospitals, keanels and pounds

Banks

Barber and beauty shops

Car wash

Civic administration

Clinic—outpatient

Dry cleaning and laundries: pick-up and defivery stations
and self-service

Edueational occupancies for students above the 12th grade

Electronic data processing

Laboratories: testing and research

Motor vehicle showrooms

Post ofiices

Print shops

Professional services {architects, attorneys, dentists, physi-
ciang. engineers, etc.) '

Radio and television stations

Telephone exchanpes

Training and skill development not within a school or aca-
demic program

304.1.1 Definitions. The following words and terms shail,
for the purposes of this section and as used elsewhere in this
code, have the meanings shown herein.

CLINIC, QUTPATIENT. Buildiags or portions thereof
used (o provide medical care on less than a 24-hour basis to
individuais who are not rendered incapable of self-preserva-
tion by the services provided.




TEOCMR: STATE BOARD OF BUILDING REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS

T80 CMR. MASSACHUSETTS SENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING

CUDE 2069

CHAPTER 34: EXISTING STRUCTURES

34011 Replace as foliows:

B0

34{H.1 Scope. Chanter 34 of the Jnrernationa! Building Code 2009 (1RO 2060) 1s deieted in its
entirety. The alieration, repair, addition, and change of ocoupancy of existing buildings shall be
controtied by the provisions of the inlemational Existing Building Code 2000 (IEBC 2009) and
15 sppendices, and as modified wits Massachusetts Amendments as follows:

101.1 Renlace as follows:

ML Tide These reguiations shall be known as the Existing Building Code of
Massachusetts, referred to as “this code.”

101.2 Replace az fallows:

1612 Beope. The provisions of this code shail apply to the repair, slteration, change of
Occupancy, addition, end relocation of existing buildings, except as otherwise regquired
by section 102.2.2,

All references in this code to the International Fuel Gas Code, International
Fhambing Code, Internationat Property Matnienance Code, International Fire C, ode, and
the International Elecirical Code, are superseded ag applicable by MA specialty codes
per subscction 101.4 of the Massachusetts Amendments W the International Auilding
Code 2000, unless noted otherwise further on within these amendments. In addition
subsection [01.] of the Massachusetts Amendments to the fnternatione! Building Code
2008, 101 4 notes Massachugetts specialty codes as they apply to environmental protes.
tion, water poliution conirol, alevators, and accessibility. Reference elsewhers in this
code o the International Building Code shall mean 780 OMR Base Fohme, Reference
clsewhere i this cade 1o the existing buildings pertaining 1o the International Residential
Code shall meas 780 CMR Cne- and Two-jamily Dwelling and the existing building
provisions contined therein, The requirements in this code for construstion of existing
buildings in flood hazard areas and/ar coastal dunes shall not apply and instead 780 CMR
Appendix G shall apply.

H 150 Add subsections:

161.5.8 Compliance Alternatives. Except for structural work, where compliance with
the provisions of the code for new construction, reguired by this code, is impractical
because of construction difficulties or regulatory conflicts, compliance altemnatives may
be aceepted by the building official, Exampies of complinnce alternatives and archale
construction systems can be found at the FAQ link at MWW mass povidps. The huilding
official tiay scceptthese compliance alternatives, archaic construction systems, or others
propesed. If the compliance alternative involves fire protection sysiems the bullding
afficial shall consult with the fire official,

101.5.0.1 Submittals. The application fora budlding permii shall be in accordance
with subsection 107.2.1 of the Iniernational Building Code 2009 with Massachusetts
Amendments (780 CMR 107.2.1) and identify all items of non- or partial compliance
with the requirements of this code, and compliance altematives, ifany are proposed,
for approval by the building official, The building official shali respond to the
avcepiability of any proposed compliance alternatives within 30 days of the filing of
the buifding permil aplication. Where proposed compliance alternatives are, in the
opinion of the building official, unacceptable, or where jgsues of non-compliance
rematn, the peymit applicant shal! have the remedies prescribed by section [ 13 of the
Intzrnaiional Building Code 2009 with the Massachusetts Amendments (780 MR
1313,

101.5.1 Delew the texr ‘in buil YHngs complying with the niernaional Fire Code’
AAHdd subsection:

HL5.4.0 Investigation and Evaluation, For any proposed work regulated by this code
end subject to subsection 1076 of ihe Imsernational Building Code 2009 with
L

Massachusetts Amendments {780 CMR 107.8) as & condition of the issuance of a
building permit the i uilding owner shall cause the exesting building {or pordon thereaf S/
i be investigated and evaiuated in sccordance with the provisions of this code. This may -
Inctude, but not be Himied 100 evaluation of destpn gravity loads, lateral load Capacity, .
MH__M%M e

T80 CMR - Erghih Edision — 133




¢

7o

o

86110

1101.1 Replace this section as follows:

11011 Scope. 1t is the intent of this chapter to provide means for the preservation of hlsoric
bulldings as certified by the Massachuserts Historical Cemmission. There is no cbligaiion for
awners of histone bulidings to use the provisions ol this chapter. This chapler shail preempt ol
other regulations o 780 CMR governing the reconstuction, renavation, alteration, change ofuse
and ocoupancy, repair, mainlenance and additians for the conformity of historic buildings and
structures to 780 CMR, with the sxception of section 113 of the Infernationa) Burlding Code
2009 with Massachusetts Amendments (780 CMR 113} for appeaiz, or unless otherwise
specified. In case of firs or other casualty w s hissoric building, said buiiding may be rebuilt, in
total or in part, using such technigues and materials us Are necessary to restore 1o s original
condition and use group. If s buiiding or structure ss a result of prososed work would become
eligible for certification as 2 Aisioric buiiding and the Massashusetts Historical Commissian so
certifies by affidavit, and such affidavit ic submitied to the building afficial with the permit
application, then the building official shall have the autherity 1 allow the work io proceed under
the provisions of this chapter

H0L2 Replace sll references to ‘museim’ with “house museum

T80 CMR - Eighth Sdition - 147



780 CMR: STATE BOARD OF RUILDING REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS l

34.00: continued

1101.5 Replace this subsestion as follows:

11025 Replacement. Replacemen: of existing or missing features uging ariginal materials
shall be permitted. Partial replacement for repairs that maich the eriginal in confipuration,
height, and size shall be permitted. Such replacements shall not be required to mest the
materials and methods requirements of section 501,2. Individual components of an existing
building systern may be repaired or replaced in kind without requiring the system o comply
with the code for new construction.

1162.5 Delete the Exception,
1163.1 Replace as follows:

1103.1 Seope. Historic buildings undergaing alterations, or that are moved ghal} comply
with section 1103,

_}K@ 1143.2 Replace as follows:
¢ 1103.2 General.

110320 Maximum Qceupaney. Howse musenm oceupancy shall be limited by the
actual structural foor ioad capacity as certified by 2 qualified Massachusetts registered
professional engineer or archifect or in accordance with Chaprer 10 of the Infernational
Building Code 2009 with Massachusetts Amendments (780 CMR. 10.00), whichever ia
less. Said floor lozd shall be posted in accordance with the procedures sef forth in
Chapter | of the International Building Code 2009 with Massachusetts Amendments
(780 CMR [.00}. The owner shall submit evidence of &is certification and rolated
somputations to the building official upon request,

1103.3 Replace as follows;

1183.3 Means of Egress. FExisting door openings and corridor and stairway widths less than
those specified elsewhere in this cods may be sporoved, provided that, m the opinion of fhe
buliding afficial, there is sufficient width and height for  person to pass through the opening
or traverse the means of egress. When approved by the budlding official, the front or main
exit doors need not swing in the direction of the puth of exit travel, provided that other
approved means of egress having sufficient capacity 1w serve the ol accupant lead are
provided.

Where one or more floors of & house museum are limited to one means of egress, the
occupancy load shall be computed as follows:

I. Floors below the First Story, Not more thar one ocoupant per 100 square feet of
pgrass floor arez with a maximum pecupancy of 49,

2. First Story. Not more than one occupant per 50 sguare feet of gross floor area, i
3. Second Story and Above. Notmore than one occupant per 100 square feat of gross
floor area, or 30 occupanis per 22 inch unit of egress widtk, whichever condition resulizs

in the lesser ocoupsncy load.

1103.12 Replace as follows:

’ FID3.12 Fire Protection Equipment. Fire protection equipment shall be provided for house
mugenms according o the following requirements:

I, Manual Fire Extinguishing Equipment. Al use groups, other thap R-3 and R4,

shell have epproved manual fire extinguishing eovipment, s determined by the head of

the local fire department,

2. Fire Alarm Systems. Use groups B-1, R-2 and R-3 shall conform to the

requirements ofsection 907 of the fnternational Building Code 2009 with Magsachusetts

Amendments (780 CMR 907), as applicable, All other use groups shall comply with

sectian 110302 ftems Z.0a) and (b} of the Infernationg! Bullding Code 2009 with

Magsachuseits Amendments (780 CMR 1103.12 #tems 2.(a) and (b)),
() Locatiens. Provide smoke detectors in accordance with manufacturers iisting
and spacing requirements, but not less than one, for avery 1200 sauare feet of Hoar
arez per ievel. In addition, all iobbies, common comidors, haliways and exitway
access and discharge routes shali be provided with approved smoke detectors
instalied ir accordance with the manufacturers listing and spacing requirsments but
not more than 30 feet spacing between detectors. Alirequired smoke defestors shall
have an alarm audivle throughout the structure or building,

B/G/T TR0 CMR - Eighth Ediiion - 143

&




780 CMR: STATE BOARD OF BUILDING REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS

34.00: continuad

(b} Single Station ang Multiple Station Smoke Detection Devices. Ag reguired
by Chaster ¢ of the Miernaiional Building Code 2000 with Massachusetis
Amendments (780 CMR 9.00).

3. Manual Pull Stations. A manual fire alarm pull station ghal] be rrovided in the

natural path of egress in a1l nse groups except R-3 and R-4, Manual puli stations shal)

be connested ip the building fire warning system in conformance with NFPA 72,
Exception, Historic buildings which are provided with ap, approved autematic fire-
extinguishing system throughout shall not be required to be provided with manual
fire sxtinguishing cquipment. Sroke detection devices shall not be required in
vccupancies other thap Use Groups B-1, R-2, and R.3,

1103.12.1 Supervision, Fire alarm systems required by this section shall be supervised

In accordance with the requirements of Chapter & of the International Building Code

2008 with Massachusetis Amendments (786 CMR 9.00),

Exception. Residential single and multiple station smoke detectors.
1164.1 Repiace this ssetion as foliows:
~ 1104.1 Accessibility Reguirements. For aceessibility requirements refor to 521 CMR,

184.1.1 through 1104.1.4 Delete,

114515 Replace this seeting ag follows;
116515 Accessibiiity requirements. For accessibility requirements refer to 521 CMR,
1106.1 Replace this section as follows:

&é H06.1 General, Higtoric buildings shall comply with the appiicable structura) provisiong
At for the work as classified in Chapter 4.
' Exceptiens
I The building official shall be authorized (o accept existing fioors and anprove
operationa] controls that limit the live load an any such floor.
2, House musenms need not comply with the wind Joad and seismic load
redqurernents of this code.

S S s RS et



i

R

L S R R

CHAPTER 4
CLASSIFICATION OF WORK

SECTION 401
GENERAL

4601.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall be used in
conjunction with Chapters 5 through 12 and shall apply o the
aiteration, rapair, addition and change of vecupancy of exise

ing structures, inchuding historic and moved souctures, as ref-

erenced in Section 101.5.2. The work performed on an existing
building shali be classified In sccordance with this chapter.

461.1.1 Compliance with other alternatives, Alterations,
repeirs, additions and changes of occupancy to existing
structures shall comply with the provisions of Chapters 4
through 12 or with one of the alternatives provided in Sec-
tion 101.5.

401.2 Worl ares. The work area, a5 defined in Chapter 2, shail
be identified on the construction documents.

461.3 Occupancy and use. When delermining the appropriate
application of the referenced sections of this code, the occu-
pancy and use of a building shall be determined in accordance
with Chapter 3 of the Infernarional Building Code.

SECTION 402
REPAIRS

402.1 Scope. Repairs, as defined in Chapter 2, include the
patching or restoration or replacement of damaged materials,
elements, equipment or fixtures for the purpose of maintaining
such compunents in good or sound condition with respect to
axisang loads or performance requirements.

402.2 Application. Repairs shall comply with the provisions
of Chapter §.

402.3 Related work. Work on nendamaged components that is
necessary for the required repaiy of damaged components shail
be considered part of the repair and shall not be subject o the
provisions of Chapter 6, 7, 8, 9 or 10,

SECTION 403
ALTERATION-—LEVEL 1
403.1 Scope. Level | alterations inciude the removal and
replacement or the covering of existing materials, elements,
equipment, or fixtures using new materials, elements, equip-
ment, or fixtures that serve the same purpose.

403.2 Application. Level | alierations shall comply with the
previsions of Chapler 6. '

SECTION 404
ALTERATION—LEVEL 2

404.1 Scope. Level 2 alterations include the reconfiguration of
Space, the addition or elimination of any door or window, the

2608 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING CODE®

reconfiguration or extension of any system, or the ingtallation
of any additional equipment.

404.2 Application. Leve] 2 afterations shall comply with the
provisions of Chapter 6 for Level | afferations as well as the
provisicns of Chapter 7, :

SECTION 405
ALTERATION—LEVEL 3

405.1 Scope. Level 3 alterations apply where the work areq
exceeds 50 percent of the aggregate area of the building,

403.2 Application. Level 3 alterations shall comply with the
provisions of Chapters 6 and 7 for Level ! and 2 alrerations,
respectively, as well as the provisions of Chapter 8,

SECTION 408
CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY

406.1 Scope. Change of occupancy provisions apply where the
actvity is classified as a change of occupancy as defined in
Chapter 2.

406.2 Application. Changes of occupancy shall comply with
the previsions of Chapier 9.

SECTION 467
ADDITIONS

487.1 Scope. Provisions for additions shall apply where work
i classified as an addivion as defined in Chapter 2,

407.2 Application. Additions to existing buildings shali com-
ply with the provisions of Chapter 10.

SECTION 408
HISTORIC BUILDINGS

468.1 Scope. Historic buildings provisions shall apply to build-
ings classified as historic as defined in Chapter 2.

408.2 Application. Except as specifically provided for in
Chapter 11, historic buildings shall comply with applicable
provisions of this code for the type of work being performed,

SECTION 409
RELOCATED BUILDINGS

409.1 Scope. Relocated buildings provisions shall apply to
reloczated or moved buildings.

409.2 Application. Relocated buildings shail comply with the
provisions of Chapter 12,

23




CHAPTER 11
HISTORIC BUILDINGS

SECTION 1101
GENERAL

1161.1 Scope. 1t i the intent of this chapter to provide medns
for the Preservation of historic buildings. Hisiorica] buildings
shall comply with the provisions of this chapter relatin g to their
repair, alieration, relocation and charge of occupaney.

1161.2 Report. A historic building undergoing repair, glzer

afion or change of Otlupancy shail be investigated and evalu-
ated, If it is intended thar the building mee the requiremeants of
this chapter, 2 written repor: shail be prepared and filed with the
code official by a registered design professional when such a
report js necessary in the opinion of the code afficigl. Such
teport shali be in accerdance with Chapter 1 and shafi tdentify

or E, a structural evaluation describing,
plete load path and ather earthquake-
prepared, Additionally, the report shal

at minimurg, 4 com-

describe anch feature

1101.3 Special sccupancy eXceptions—imnusenms, When a
building ig Group'R-3 is also used for Group A, B, or M pur-

accordance with Section 1 I01.2. Adequate means of egress in
such buiidings, which may include a means of maintaining
doors in an Opet position to permjy egress, a limit on building
Gicupancy 10 an vccupant load permigteg by the means of
CETESS capacity, a limit o GCCUpARCyY of certain areas or ficors,
Or supervision by Person knowledgeabie iy the emergency
exiting procedures, shaj] be provided,

11614 Flood hazard areas. In flood hazard areas, if alf pro-
posed work, including repairs, work required because of
change of occupancy, and alterations, constitutes Substanial
improvement, then the existing butiiding shyl] comply with Sec-
tion 1612 of the Internationg] Bullding Cody.

Exception: If a; historic building will contipue tobe an fis-
107ic building after the Proposed work is comipleted, then the
Proposed work is not considerad Asubstantial improvemen .
For the purposes of this exception, ap historic building is:

i Listed or preliminarily detarinined 1o be eligible for
fisting in the Nationa] Register of Histaric Places:

2 the U.S. Department

- Determineg by the Secretary of
of Interior to contribute to the historien significance
of aregistered historic digtrics or adistdet prefiminar.

ily determined 1o qualify s 2 histoge district; or

2009 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BULLDING Copp®

tures. For buildings ass1gned to Seismie Design Category D, E -

esistant featurey shall be -

f

o1 local histon‘c
i8 approved by the Depart.

3. Designated a5 historic under 2 state
Preservation program that
ment of [nterigr,

SECTION 1102
REPAIRS

1102.1 General, Repairs to any portion of an historie butlding
Or Stracture shall be permitted with original or fike malerialy
and original methods of tonstruction, subject (g the provisions
of this chapter, '

1162.2 Dangerans buildings, When an Aisioric building is
determined to he dangerous, no work shall be required excepr
45 necessary o correct identified angafe conditions.

1102.3 Relocated buildings, Foundations of relacated higiopie
buildings and structures shaj) comply with the Internarionay
Building Code. Relocated historie buildings shall utherwise he
considered un hisiopie building for the Purposes of this code.
' i and structires shall pe sited so thar

exterior wali and opening requirements comply with the /nzer.

1102.4 Chapter 5 compliance. Historie buildings undergoing
repairs shali comply with all of the applicable requirements of
Chapter 5, except ug specifically permitted in this chapter,

125 Replacement. Replacement of existing or missing fea-
tures using or ginal materials shall be pérmitted. Partia]
replacement for Tepairs that mawch the original in configura.
tion, height, apd size shall he permitted, Syck replacements
shali not he required to meet the materiais and methads require.
ments of Section 5012,

Exception: Replacement glazing in nazardous Incationg
shall comply with the safety glazing requirements of Chap.-
ter 24 of the Internarional Building Cude.

SECTION 1103
FIRE SAFETY

1103.1 Scope. Historic buildings tndergaing alterations,
changes of Sccupancy, or that are moved shaf] comply with
Section 1103,

1103.2 General, Every historic building thay does not conform
10 the construction fequirements specified i this code for the
veeupancy or use and thar consltitutes a distinet fire hazard g
defined herein shall be provided with an approved autornatic
I’Ere~extinguishing SYstemn as determined appropriate by the
code gfficial. However, ap automatic fire-extinguishin g system
shall not be used 1p substitute for, or gy 48 an alternative g, the
required number of exits from any facility.

1103.3 Meang of ERTeSS. Existing door openings and corridor
and stairway widths less than those Specified elsewhere i this

53



HISTORIC BUILDINGS

code may be approved. provided that, in the cpinion of the code
official, there is sufficient width and haight for 2 person to pass
through the opening or traverse the means of egress. When
approved by the code official, the front or main exit doors nesd
not swing in the direction of the path of exit travel, provided
that other approved means of earess having sufficient capasity
to serve the wtal occupant load are provided.

1103.4 Transoms. In fully sprinklered buildings of GroupR-1,
R-Z or R-3 occupancy, existing transoms in corridors and other
fire-resistance-rated walls may be maintained if fixed i the
closad positon, A sprinkler shall be installed op each side of
the transom,

1103.5 Interior finishes. The existing finishes of walls and
ceilings shell be acoepied when itis demonstrazed that they are
the historic fimishes,

1103.6 Stairway enclosure. In buildings of three stories or

less. exitenclosure construction shall lmit the spread of smoke
by the use of tghe-fitting doors and solid elements. Such sle-
ments are not required to bave a fire-resistance rating,

11637 One-hour fire-resistant assemblies. Where }-hour
fire-resistance-rated construction is required by these provi-
s1ons, it ased not be provided, regardless of construction or
otcupancy, where the existing wail and ceiling linish is wood
or metal [ath and plaster.

1163.8 Glazing in fire-resistance-rated systems. Historic
glazing materials wre permitted in interior walls reguired 0
have a 1-hour fire-resistance rating where the Gpening is pro-
vided with approved smoke seals and the area affected is pFO-
vided with an automatic sprinkler system.

1103.9 Stairway raitings. Grand stairwayg shal! be accepted
without complying with the handrail and guard requirements.
Existing handrails and guards at ail stairs shall he permitted 1o
remain, provided they are not structurally dangerous.

1103.10 Guards. Guards shall comply with Sections 1103.10.1
and 1102.50.2.

1103.10.1 Height. Existing guards shall comply with the
requirements of Section 503,

1103.10.2 Guard openings: The spucing between existing
intermediate railings or openings in existing ornamentnl
panerns shall be accepted. Missing slements or members of
a guard may be replaced in a manner that will preserve the
historic appearance of the building or swucture.

1303.11 Exit slgns. Where exit sign or egress path marking
location would damage the historic character of the building,
alternative exit signs are permitted with approval of the code
official. Alternative signs shall identify the exits and BEress
path.

1103.12 Automatic fire-extinguishing systems. Every iistor-
ieal building that cannot be made to conform to the construe.
tion requiremenis specified in the fniemarional Building Code
for the oeeupancy or use and that constinmtas o distinet fire haz-
ard shall be deemed to be in compliance ¥ provided with an
approved automatic fire-extinguishing system.

Exception: When the code official approves ap alterna-
tive life-safety system.

e

A Y
A
SECTION 1104 !«ég?‘ a

ALTERATIONS 407 [

-L';jll(}fi.l Accessibility requirements. The provisions of 605
i and 706, as applicable, shall apply to buildings and facilites
designated as historic structures that underge alterations,
unless rechnically infeasible. Where compliznce with the
requirements for accessible routes, entrances or toilet facilities
would threaten or destroy the hisioric significance of the bujid-
ing or facility, as determined by the code official, the alternative
requirements of Sections 1104.1.1 through 1704.1 4 for that
element shall be permitted,

1104:0.1 Site arrival points. At Jeast one main entrance
shall bi, acoessible.

1104.1. 2Wiuttilevel buildings and facilities, A accessible
route from, an accessible entrunce o public spaces on the
level of the geeessible entrance shudl be provided.

1194.1.3 Ené“n;\ir:ces. At Jeast one main entrance shall be
accessible. ’

Exceptions:

[. Ifa main{, mtrance cannoet be made accessible, an
accessibiz n}ﬂmpubiic entrance that is unlocked
while the buildigg is oceupied shall be provided: or

g b

.4 5, \ .
20f ;ﬁ{mam entrandg, canmot be made accessible a

logked accessible etitrance with a notification sys-
M Or remote monit&@ng shall be providad.

1104.34 Toilet and bathing facilities. Where toilet rooms
are ptovided, at least one accessible family or assisted-uge
toilet rousm complying with Section 1109.2.1 of the Fnterng-
ticnal Building Code shall be provided.

SECTION 1105
CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY

1185.1 General. Historic buildings andergoing a change of:
eccupancy shall comply with the applicsble provisions o
Chapter 9, except as specifically penuitted in this chapte
When Chapter 9 requires compliance with specific require
ments of Chapter 3, Chapter 6, or Chapler 7 and when thos
requirements are subject to the exceptions in Section 11072, th
same exceptions shall apply o this section,

11022 Building area. The allowable floor area for histo

buildings undergoing a change of occupancy shall be permitied
i0 excezd by 20 percent the aliowable arens specified in Cha
ter 5 of the International Building Code.

11083 Location on property. Historic siructures undergd]
achange of use to a higher hazard category in accordance’
Section P12.6 may vse alternative methods o comply wi

Tire-resistance and exterior Opening profeciive requirern
Such alternatives shall comply with Section 1101.2.
1105.4 Gccupancy separation. Required oceupency Seg
tions of 1 haur may be omitted when the building is pro
with an approved automatic sprinkier system throaghou

1108.5 Reof covering, Regardless of occupancy or bise g
rovf-covering materials notless than Class Cshall be permi
where 1 {ire-retardant roof covering is required.

2006 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING ©



1H¥5.6 Means of egress. Existing door openings and corridor
and stairway widths less than those that would be accepiable
for nonbistorie buildings under these provisions shall be
approved, provided that, in the opinion of the code official,
there is sufticient width and height for a person to pazs through
the apening or traverse the exit and that the capacity of the exit
system is adequate for the cecupant load, or where other opera-
tional controls to Himit occupancy are approved by the code

official.

1105.7 Door swing. When approved by the code official, exist-
ing front doors need not swing In the direction of exit travel,
provided that other approved exits having sufficient capacity to
serve the total occupant load are provided.

1105.8 Transoms. In corridor walls required by these provi-

sions to be fire-resistance vated, existing transoms may he 5;:/

matntained i fixed in the closed position, and fixed wired glass
setip 4 steel frame or other approved glazing shail be installed
on one side of the oansom,

Exception: Transoms confurming to Section 1103.4 shall
be accepiad,

1105.9 Finishes. Where inierior finish materials are required
to have & flame spread index of Clags C or better, existing
noaconforming materials shall be surfaced with approved
fire-retardant paint or finish.

Exeeption: Existing nonconforming materials need not be
surfaced with an approved fire-retardant paint or finish
where the building is equipped throughout with an auto-
miatic fire-suppression system installed in accordance with
the fmremerional Building Code and the noncenforming
maierials can be substaptiated os being historic in character,

1105.36 Ome-hour fire-resistant assemblies. Where 1-hour
fire-resistance-rated construction is recuired by these provi-
sions, it need not be provided. regardless of construction or
occupancy. where the existing wall and ceiling finish is wood
ath and plaseer; '

1165.11 Stairs and railings. Existing stairways shall comply
vith the requirements of these provisiens. The code official
ajl grant alternatives for stairways and raifings if alternative
strways are found 1o be accepiable or are judged to meet the
tentof these provisions. Existing stairways shall comply with
ecion 1103,

-':;cept?on: For buildings less than 3,000 square feet (279
Jvexisiing conditions are perminted to remain at all stairs
fd rails,
12 Exit stgns. The code official may sccept altermative
£ locations where such signs would damage the historic
erof the building or structire. Such signs shall identify
£and exit path.
Bt stair five joad. Existing historic stairways in
senged i a Group R-§ or R-2 occupancy shall be
where itcan be shows that the stai WO Can Support a
"PEI-sUuare-foar {366 ke/m?) live load.

LR

G

a Pah Ty e o . N : e
Iﬁgﬁai light. When 11 ts determined by the code gffi-
o, P ; ‘ -
"\éi;idi'ce With the natural ight requirernents of Sec-
= tad o loss of historic character or historic

RN};T‘ONAL EXISTING BUILDING cange®

HISTORIC BUILDINGS

materials in the building, the existing level of natural lighting
shall be considered acceptabie,

1105.15 Accessihility requirements. The pravisions of Sec-
ton 912.8 shall apply to buildings and facilites designated as
historic strucwures that undergo a change of secupancy, unless
rechically infeasible. Where compliance with the require-
ments for accessible routes, ramps, entrances, or toilet facilities
would threaten or destroy the historic significance of the build-
ing or facility, as determined by the authority having jurisdic-
ton. the alternative requirements of Sections 1 104.1.] through
1104.1.4 for these elements shall be permitted.

SECTION 1106
STRUCTURAL

1106.1 General. Historic buiklings shall comply with the
appiicable structural provisions for the work as classified in
Chapter 4.

Exception: The code official shall be avthorized to aceept
existing floors and approve operational controls that limit
the live load on any such floor,

1106.2 Unsafe structural elements. Where the code official
determines that a component or a portion of a building or struc-
ture is dangerous as defined in this code and is in need of
repair, sirengthening, or replacement by provigions of this
code, only that specific component or portion shail be required
Lo be repaired, strengthened or replaced.

bl
R

& 521 CmE



R

s

S

S AL e el
ST 41

;o P
{JQ;M fﬁﬁfﬁfﬂf g

[ ELedin

T

[

CHAPTER 4
CLASSIFICATION OF WORK

SECTION 401
GENERAL

403.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall be used in
conjunction with Chapters 5 through 12 and shall apply to the
alteration, repair, addition and change of occupancey of exis-
ing structures, including historle and moved structures, as rel-
erenced in Section 101.5.2. The work performed on an extsiing
building shall bz classified in accordance with this chapter,

401.1.1 Compliance with other alternatives. Alrerations.
repairy, addifions and changes of occupancy to existing
structures shall comply with the provisions of Chapters 4
through 12 or with one of the alternatives provided in Sec-
tion 101.5.

401.2 Work area. The work areq, as defined in Chaptar 2, shail
“he ideniified on the construction documents.

401.3 Occupancy and use. When determining the appropridte
application of the referenced sections of this code, the occu-
pancy and use of 2 building shall be determined in accordance
with Chapter 3 of the /nfernational Building Code.

SECTION 402
HEPAIRS

4i12.1 Scope. Repairs, as defined in Chapter 2, include the
pawching or restoration or replacement of damaged materials,
elements, equipment ar fixtures for the purpose of maintaining
such components in good or sound condition with respect to
existing loads or performance requirements.

402.2 Application. Repairs shall comply with the provisions
of Chapter S,

402.3 Related work, Work on nondamaged components that is
necessary for the required repair of damaged companents shall

- be considered part of the repair and shall not be subject w the

provisiens of Chapter 6,7, 8, 9 or 10,

SECTION 403
ALTERATION—LEVEL 1

403.1 Scope. Level 1 alterations include the removal and
replacement or the covering of existing materials, elements,
equipment, or fixires using new materialg, slements, sguip-
ment, or fixtures that serve the same purpose.

403.2 Application. Lavel 1 glierarions shall comply with the
provisions of Chapter 6,

SECTION 404
ALTERATION—LEVEL 2

2B4.1 Scope. Level 2 aiterations include the reconfiguration of
Space, the addition or elimination of any dosr ar window, the

2008 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING cooe®

reconfiguration or extension of any system, or the instzllation
of any additional eguipment.

404.2 Application. Level 2 alterations shall comply with the
provisions of Chapter 6 for Level 1 alterarions as well as the
provisions of Chapter 7

SECTION 405
ALTERATION—LEVEL 3

405.1 Beupe. Level 3 alterations apply where the waork areg
exceeds 50 percent of the aggregate area of the building,

405.2 Application. Leve! 3 alterations shall comply with the
provisions of Chapters 6 and 7 for Level 1 and 2 alterations,
respectively, as well as the provisions of Chapter 8. '

SECTION 406
CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
406.1 Scope. Change of occupancy provisions apply where the
activity is classified as a change of occupancy as defined in
Chapter 2.

406.2 Application. Changes of accupancy shall comply with
the pravisions of Chapter 9.

SECTION 407
ADDITIONS

497.1 Scope. Provisions for additions shall apply where work
15 classified as an addirion as defined in Chapter 2.

407.2 Appitcation. Additions to existing buildings shall com-
ply with the provisions of Chapter 10,

SECTION 408
HISTORIC BUILDINGS

408.1 Scope. Historic buildings provisions shal] apply to bulid-
ings ciassified as historic as defined in Chapter 2.

408.2 Application. Except as specifically provided for in
Chapter 11, historic buildings shall comply with applicable
provisions of this code for the type of work being performed.

SECTION 409
RELOCATED BUILDINGS

409.1 Scope. Relocated buildings provisions shall apply 1o
relocated or moved butidings.

48,2 Application, Relocated buildings shall comply with the

provisions of Chapier 12,



CHAPTER 6 | .
ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 1 -

SECTION 601 ‘ not increasad and the system tength is not ipe
GENERAL creased even if the njtered System does not

‘ ‘ . e meet code minimyms.
681.1 Scope, Leve] | dlierations as described o Section 403

shall comply with the requitements of this chapter, Leve] | Al of Chapier 5, entitled “Chimneys and Ve
alterations to %}Lﬁt(){ép buildings shall comply with this chapter, ' 40 All of Chapter 6, entitled “Specific Appiianges.”
except as wodilied in Chapter 11, ;
601.2 Conformance. Ap existing building or portion thereof 3
shall not be altersd such thyt the building becomes less gafe SECTION 603 -
than Hs existing condition, FIRE PROTECTION - {{%
Exception: Where the current fevel of safety or sanitation is 603.1 General. Altergtions shall be done in & manper that « ;‘{3
proposed o be reduced, the portion altered shall conform to- - maintiuns the devel of fire protection provided, \Q( 3
the requirsments of the {niernarional Building Code. Go3. 0 M V}J ¢ -Fgﬁ %’:;E«"i 42’” AL RN
. \ . Sra O il e o=
601.2 Flood hazard areas, In flood hazard areus, alterations /SECT]ON 604
that constitute substantiol improvement shai; require that the E
i v Coa N (o ‘ ANS OF E S8
building comply with Section 1612 of the International Build. u GF}DECF?JC?C,G
ing Code. 604.1 General, Repairs Sh%e done ia"a mamize that maiy.
taing the lavel of protectioy prévide for the means of egress,
1 accutbana Ly 0w 7 B ¢ A
. A PITE N
SECTION 602 o o g Conte
BUILDING ELEMENTS AND MATERIALS SECTION 895 < Wl
602.1 Interior finishes. Af tewly installed interior wall and ACCESSIBILITY LA _Egm{;
ceiling finishes shall comply with Chapter 8 of the frerne- 605.1 General, 4 butlding, Facibier 17 element that is alters
g piy F ‘ ’ » YU eler ! '
tional Building Cuode. shallcomply with the applicabie provisions in Sections 605,14
602.2 Interior floor finish. New interior floor fnish includ- through 605,14, Chagter 11 of the internationg! Buileling

Code and ICC A L17.] unissgs it srechnicaliy infeasiple, Where
compliance with this section iy techmcally infeasible, the alte,
atonshall provide aceess to the Maximum extent that is ‘echni-

ing new carpeting used as sn interior fioor finish marerial, shall
comply with Section 804 af e lriernational Buiiding Code.

802.3 Interior trim, All newly installed interior rim nEMerialy caily feasible.
shall comply with Section 306 of the lnrernaiional Building L s : .
Code Py : ¢ A building, fuciiity or element that is constructed ar alered

to be accessible shall be maintained accessih
5024 Materials and methods, Al new work shall comply pancy.

with materials and methods requirernents in the Internarional

le during oooy-

N ) . . Exceptions:
Building Code, Internationa Energy Conservation Code, Exceplions
Infernational Mechanica Code, and internarional Plumbing [ The altered element or Space is not required (o be on
Code, as applicable, that s reciy matertal standards, detajl of an aceessible route uniess required by Section 6052,
, P pecify ;

stallnt: el NS T e eretrati v el o i Ey - e . - ) .
instaliation and LonASClon, juints, pen trations, and conbinutty 7. Accessibic means of egress required by Chapter 111 0!

Uf’;‘:i’""""} IO S SVRIEM | e bulldiny. . e - . c
ny element, comporent, o st in the building the Iniernational Building Code gre nolreguired 1o be

[FG1602.4.1 Internationas Fuel Gas Code. The following provided in existing buildings and facilities.
sections of the faternational Fuet Gas Coele shall constitule

the fuel vas materisis and methody rec ulrerments for Level | F1O7 0F the formm 'Y e nre o
= HAT of the fntermationa Building Cude are mo
alterations : .

requived o be provided i existing buiidings andg
LA or Chapter 3, entitled "Ceneral Fealations facilitios,
except Sections 303.7 and 304

Led

- Type B dwelling or sleeping unirg vequired by Seelinn

4 The altereiion o Type A El'ldévidutu owned dwell-

Al of Chapier 4, entited “Ciax Piping Installations,” ingunits within aGroup R-2 occupancy shall mestthe
)

exoey

r2

Sections 4018 and 4023, provisions for Type B dwelling units and shall com.

=

ply with the applicable provisions in Chapter 1§ of the
3

Internativngg Burlding Code and 10T A117.1)

[

Sections 40 8 und 4923 shal) apply wher the

work beine serformed mereases the load on
-

he system such that the CXistng pipe does po 605.1.1 Entrances. Where apn alterarion includes alier.
mect the size reguired by code. Existing sys- aons 1o an entrance, and the buslding or facility hus an
EmE that are modified shall aot reguire accessible entrance op oan accessilile route, the ajrered
rEsizing as long 28 the Inad on the system is SRITAnCe 1y not required 1o be ueosssible unless reguired by

2908 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING Cope? o7



Bt vt |

ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 1

Section 603.2. Signs complying with Section 1110 of the
International Building Code shall be provided.

605.1.2 Elevators. Altered elements of existing slevators
shall comply with ASME A17.1 2nd 1CC A ] 17.1. Suchele-
ments shall aiso be aliered in elevarors programmed to
respond o the same hall call conitrol s the aliered elevator,

605.1.3 Platforn tifts. Platform ¢ wheelchair) lifts comply-
ing with TCC AT17.1 and installed in accordance with
ASME ALB.T shall be permitted as = component of an
accessible route,

605.1.4 Ramps. Wheare steeper slopes than aliowed by Sec-
tion 1010.2 of the Jnternational Building Code are necessi-
tated by space limitations, the slopeof rzmpsiner roviding
aceess 1o existing buildings or facilities shall comply with
Tabie 505.1 4,

TABLE 805,1.4

RAMPS
H 7
| SLOPE o | maxivum mise |
!Stc:epsr than 1210 but not steeper than -8 J 3 inches f
[ T
fSt&cpef@n 112 but not steeper than 1:10 | 6 inches J

For S1: 1 inch = 25 4 mm,

605.1.5 Dining aress. An accessible rogie to rased or
surken dining arcas or to outdoor sealing areas is not
required provided that the same services and decor are pro-
vided in an accessible space usable by any occupant and not
restricied {o use by people with a disability.

605.1.6 Performance areas, Where it 18 fechnically infeasi-
ble to alter performance aress 1o be on an accessible route, at
feast one of cach Lype of performance area shall be made
accessibie.

6115.1.7 Jury boxes and withess stands. In alterations,
accessible wheelchair spaces are not required 1o be Jocated
within the defined arez of rajsed jury boxes or witness
stands and shall be permitted to be locared outside these
spaces where ramp or lift access puses a hazard by restrict-
ing of projecting into o required means of egress.

605.1.8 Accessible dwelling or sieeping units. Where
Group I-1, 1-2, [-3, R-1, R-2 or R-4 dwelling or sleeping
units are being altered, the requirertents of Section 1107 of
the International Building Code for accessible units and
Chapter 9 of the fnremational Buliding Code for visible
alarms apply orly to the quantity of the spaces being altered,

605.1.9 Type A dwelling or sleeping units. Where more
than 20 Group R-2 dwelling or sleeping units are being
altered, the reguirements of Section 1107 of the nterna-
tienal Building Code for Type & units anc Chapter 9 of the
International Building Code for visible atarmms apply only 1o
the quantity of the spaces being aitersd.

605.1.70 Toilet rooms. Where i1 technically infeasible o
alter existing tailet und bathing faciiities 1o be accessible, an
accessible family or essisted-use wilet or bathing facility
constiuzied in accordance with Section HIGG2 of the
International Building Code i permitted. The family or

28

assisted-use facility shall be located on the same floor and in
the sare area as the existing facilites,

605,1.11 Dressing, fitting and locker rooms. Where it ig
technically infeasible to provide accessibie dressin g, fitling,
or locker rooms at the same location as similar types of
roomsg, one accessible room on the same leve] shall be pro-
vided. Where separate sex facilitias are provided, accessible
rocms for each sex shall be provided. Separate sex facilities
are not required where only unisex rooms are provided,

605.3.12 Fuel dispensers, Operable parts of replacement
fuel dispensers shall be permitted to be 54 inches (1370
MM} maximum measared from the surface of the vehicuiar
way where fuel dispensers are installed on existing curbe,

605.1.13 Thresholds. The maximum height of thresholds ar
doorways shzll be Y inch (191 mm). Such thresholds shall
have beveled edges on each side.

605.1.14 Extent of application. Ay alteration of an exist-
ing slement, space, or areq of 2 buiiding or facility shait not
impose a requirement for greater accessibility than that
which would be required for new construction, Alterations
shall not reduce or have the effect of reducing accessibility
of a building, portion of o building, or facility.

605.2 Alterations affecting an area containing a primary
function, Where an alteration affects the accessibility to a, or
coniains an area of, primary function, the rovie to the primaiy
Junction area shall be accessible. The accessible route to the
primary funcrion ares shall include toilet faciiities or drinking
fountaing serving the area of primary function,

Exceptions:

1. The costs of providing the accessible route are nor
required to exceed 20 percent of the costs of the alter-
ations affecting the area of primary function,

2. This provigion does not apply to allerations lmited
solely to windows, hardware, operating conirols,
electrical outlets and signs.

%]

- This provision dees not apply to allerations Limited
solely to mechanical systerns, electrical Systerms,
installation or aiteration of fire protection systems
ang abatement of hazardous materials,

4. This provision does not apply 1o alterations ander-

taken for the primary purpase of increasing the acoes-

sibility of an exisring building, facility or element.

SECTION 606
STRUCTURAL

606.1 General, Where alieratinn work inchides replacement of
equipment that is suppoited by the building or where 4
reroofing permitis required, the provisions of this gection shall
apply,

606.2 Addition or replacement of roefing or replacement of
equipment. Where addition or replacement of roofing or
replacement of equipment results in additiona dead loads,
structural components supporung such reproofing or EQUIp-

2008 INTERNATIONAL EXISTING BUILDING cone?

RIS AR

—



ment shall comply with the gravity load requirements of the
Inrernational Building Code,

Execeptions:

1. Structural elements where the additional dead load

from the roofing or squipment doss T fsrease the
force in the element by more tha

- Buildings constructed in accordance with the Interng-
tional Residential Code or the conventional
light-frame construction methods of the International
Butlding Code and where the dead load from the roof-
ing or equipment s 1ot increased by more than 5 per-
cent,

3

3. Addilion of a second layer of rocf covering weighing
3 pounds per square foot (01,1437 KN/m?) or less over
an existing, single layer of roof covering,

606.2.1 Wall anchors for concrete and masonry buiid-
ings. Where a permit is issued for rergofing more than 23
percent of the roof area of a building assigned 1o Seismic
Design Category D, B or F with 2 structural gystem consist-
ing of concrete or reinforced masonry walls with 2 flexible
roof diaphragm or uareinforced masonry walls with any
type of roof diaphragms, the work shall include installation
of wall anchors at the roof fine to resist the reduced Jnterna-
Honal Building Code ievel seismic forces ag specified in
Section 161.5 4.2 of this code and design procedures of Sec-
tion 101.5 4, unless an evaluation demonstrates compliance
of existing wall anchorage.

606.3 Additional requirements for reroof permits. The
requiremnents of this section shali apply to alteration work
requiring reroof permits.

606.3.1 Bracing for unreinforced masonry bearing wall
parapets, Where a permit Is issued for reroofing for more
than 25 percent of the roof area of a building assigned to
Seismic Design Category D, E or ¥ that has parapsts can-
structed of unreinforced masonry, the work shall include
instailation of parapet bracing to resist the reduced Inferna-
tional Building Code setsmic forces specified in Section
101.5.4.2 of this code, unless an evaluation demonstrates
compliance of such items.

606.3.7 Roof diaphragms resisting wing loads in high-
wind regions. Where roofing materials are removed from
more than 50 percent of the roof diaphragm of a building or
section of a building located where the basic wind speed is
greater than 90 mph or in a special wind region, as defined in
Section 1609 of the nternasional Building Code, roof dia-
phragms and connactions that are part of the muain
wind-force resisting systerm shall be evaluated for the wind
loads specified n the International Building Code, inciud-
ing wind uplift. If the disphragms and connections in their
current conditicn do not compiy with those wind provi-
sions, they shalf be replaced or strengthened in accordance
with the loads specified in the Inigraational Building Code.

2008 INTERNATICNAL EXISTING BUILDING cobze®

ALTERATIONS —LEVEL 1

SECTION 807
ENERGY CONSERVATION

607.1 Minimum requirements. Leve] | alterations to existing
buildings or structures are permitied without requiring the
entire building or structare to comply with the energy require-
ments of the Internarional Energy Conservarion Code or Jnser
national Residential Code. The alterations shall conform o the
SRErgy requirements of the Mniernarional Energy Conservation
Code ot International Residential Code as they relate to new
constructicn only.

23



527 CMR 12.00: 2008 MASSACHUSETTS ELECTRICAL CODE
(AMENDMENTS)

The 2008 Massachusetts Blectrical Code {527 CMR
1200} of the Board of Fire Prevention Regulations shal]
e the 2008 Wationa! Electrica) Code [NFPA 70) modi-

fied as follows:

Insert the following provisicns ahead of the body of

the Code:

Rule L.

Rule 2,

Role 3.

Rule 4.

Rule 5.

Alt- installasions, repairs and mainte-
nance of electrical wiring and electrical
fixtures used for light, heat;- power, sig-
naling and communications purposes in
buildings and structures subject to the
provisions of M.G.L. ¢, 143 .shall be rea-
sonably safe io persons and property.
Conformity of msiallations, repairs, and
maintenance of electrical wiring  and
electrical fixtures used for light, heat,
power, signaling and communications
with applicable regulations set forth in
the Cade, which is hereby filed with the
Secretary of the Cormmonwealth shall be
considered a3 complying with these re-
quiremenis.

Additions or modifications to an existing
mstailation shall be made in accordance

~with this €ode without bringing the re-

maiming part of the installation into
compliance with the requirements of this
Code. The installation shall not create a
viotation of this Code. nor shall it in-
crease the magnitude of an existing vio-
lation,

Where an actual hazard exists, the owner
of the property shall be notified in writ-

. ing by the anthority enforcing, this Code.

The notification shall contain specifica-
tons of the actual hazard that exists, to-
gether with a reference to the rule of this
Code that is now in violstion (See
M.G.L. ¢ 166, §§ 37 and 33, for en-
forcement authority.)

References are made in this code to
other standards, Those standards, where
duly adopted by law or regulation, may
be enforced by the appropriate. official.
They are not considered part of this
Code and they are not enforceable under
M.GLL. ¢ 143 § 3L. For Massachusetts
Building Code references. see Appendix
Al

(]

Rule 6.

Rule 7.

Ruile &,

Rule 9.

Rule 10,

The approving authority may be guided
;n his approval of specific items of
equipment and materials contemplated
by the Code, by proof that such equlp-
ment and materials have been tested and
couform o suitable recognized industry
standards,
327 CMR 12,60 shali be effective on al)
instailations for which a permit has been
granted subsequeni o December 31
2007
In accordance with the provisions of
M.G.L. ¢ 143 § 3L, the permit applica-
tion form to provide notice of installation
of wiring shall be uniform throughout the
Commonwealth, and applications shall be
filed on the prescribed form. After a
permit application has been accepted by
an Inspector of Wires appointed pursu-
ant to MLUG.L ¢. 166 §32. an electrical
permit shall be issned 1o the person, firm
or corporation stated on the permit ap-
plication. Such entity shall be TESponsi-
ble for the notification of completion of
the work as required in MGL 143 §3L.
Permits shall be Hmited as to the time
of ongoing construction activity, and
may be deemed by the Inspector of
Wires abandoned and invahid if he or she
has determined that the authorized work
has not commenced or has mot pro-
gressed during the preceding 12-month
period. Upon writien applicaticn, an ex-
tension of time for completion of work
shall be permitied for reasonable cause,
A pemnit shall be terminated upon the
written request of either the owner or the
installing entity stated on the perinit ap-
plication.
Installations covered by 527 CMR 12.00
shall alsu comply with M.G.L. c. 141.
Electrical installations shall not be con-
cezied or covered from view until in-
spected by the inspector of wires within
and not more than 24 hours for exterior
excavations nor more than 72 hours for
tterior installations after proper notice
to the inspector, Saturdays, Sundays, and
holidays excluded.

o O P o S L L S e




10,10

24F OMR:
3

continued

BOARD OP STATE ZXAM

UF PLUMEERS AND GAS FITTERS

Table 11 Minmum Facilipes For Building Q¢

{(*Opdonal by owner)

iERS

cupancy.

Fernnent 7

} Buildiag Clarification Use {; Tollexs i Urimals | Lavawories | Drinking | Bat/ | Other Regquations.
Grovy _ - Males | Each Sex | Fosnwin | Show. | Fixnures 248 CMR
Females| Malsg
| . 10.1(19)
Thesiers AL {1per30 {1 per 60 150% |1 per 100 |2 per 1000 1 service | (B, (L. {m).
' sink per {(n), {n)
)__ | i [floor =
Migriciubs. Pubs A2 [1per30 [pers0 [S0%  1iper7s |7 /a0 i L2 7 Ty tm o o)
Restaoerants A3 11 per 30 |1 per 60 503, . 1 per 200 //_5&0 M & {B), {m), (n), {p)
Hall, Musenms, Librarss Fre, [A-3 13 per 50 {1 per 100050% 1 per 205 ‘ (B}, (it (m).
Y1000 1w
‘Coliscums, Arenas A3 1T per 30 {1 per 60 1504, 1 per 150 :/fa«w y {2}, (L. {m),
3 | {n), (p})
F'must: of Warship At 1 per 50 |1 per 10050% |1 per 200 Vy oo se bl ) m.
F (), (p)
iStadivms Ete. |A-5 |1 per 30 |1 per 60 |50 tperist | Jro05 o | iy,
| (o) a
jpna; A5 (Tper a0 |l per a0 133% |1 per 60 At jeast 1) for (. (m), i,
{ ? bathers [bathers bathers one sburce|svery 40 p {(p). See DS
! bathers J’ CMER for bather
load. .
Bathing Public Braches) L per 2000 per 500{33 9, b per 1000 1 per ! Bervice(d}, (m), in), {p}
. 1000 Sink
Dy Care Faciliry {Child) E-1-3 11 per 20 1 per 20 1per 20 1 Servizel{e), (m), (n)
) Sink
{S1aff) IN/A | per 20 i1 per 25 {338 ! peraQ {1}, (=, ), ()
Detzndon Facility (Detsinee) |13 |1 per 6 1 per 8 335 . tper 6 | | per & (. (m) 5y |
{5ttty NiA_|1per 20 [1per 25 [35% 11 por 40 | (i), (m}, ), ()]
Dwellings (Singlej R Une Bathroom Group and Ons Kitechen Sink (o), (g} ?
(Multiple} R {Onc Bathreom Group and One Khchen Sink per Unit (e, {gq} Il
i{Howelivipe)) R |One Batwoom Group per Unit . Hm), ()
(Domitories) B2 [yperé 1per® 33% [ perg tper 8 {1 Servicel(g), (m), (n), (p)
f Sink per
‘ ] ! Floor |
\Educational (Kinderganen) |5 11 per 20 {1 per 20 Iiper20 |1 per 75 (8, 33, (m), {n),
. D)
{Etsmentary) £ 11 p2r 30 H per 66 {3 per 6 El per 60 1 per 75 J l‘Sf:r:c::
|(Secondary) E  [1per30 )1 per o0 (per0 Dper oo 1 per 73 Jf_::;‘ =
[[Fost Seandary) E 1per 90 |5 per VBT per 1BOU) per 180 1) par 75 :
SLaff) E__1per20 [1per3s (3% |1 perag |
Emplovee (MNon-Indusimaly* | Lper 20 |1 par 25 {23g E] per 4 bper 1391 Servicei(i), (i), Iy (p)‘
Sisk per
| L |

311708

)

g

8 CMR - 157



248 CMR: BOARD OF STATE EXAMINERS
OF PLUMBERS AND GAS FITTERS

10,10 continned

!

i | Toi J i Pesnent |
Building Clarification | Use e Urinals | Lavatories | Drinking | Bath/ | Other | Regulations,
Groug ! Males | Each Sex | Founwmin | Show, | Fixuwes! 228 OME
Females] Majes .

. 1010019
Lmployes (Industial Factory (F Tper 15 11 per 20 (1 per 40 {1 per 30 1 per 15 G (o, {n), {p)
Varghouss and Similar Usage
Irsucenon

Hospisal (Privats/Semi) I ! per Room ! per Room |1 Per cach {1 per 15 {1 Service (B {mg, (n)
sel of rest- ifis 30U
rooms
Mursing Homes: Lpzr 12 [Sink
! toiles and } {inpanent
lavatory with girest Tacilites
aceess from each other Lar
{bedroom (shared than i
by B beds max), i S)]
zan be unisex. Floor
Pper b
patients
{Psychi-
atric
Hosp.)
lpmr B
(Rehah
facility)
MNursing Homes {(Ward) lper 8 1 par 1D [33% per 10 iper 13 (1}, {m). (n). {p}
Malls {Covered) M Pponr 1537 per 50% Uper 2000 |} per 2000 I Servieef(i) (13, (m), {n},
- 1500 i}
Medical/Health Care Building B 1 per 45 {1 per 55 |50% 1per 200 11 Pereach {1 per {1, k), (0. (m),
i setof rest- frach se dgingy Hp)
, roGms of rest-
i Tooms
}Ofﬁ:c Buiidings B Lper 20 i per 25 133% Yper 50 1 per F}naq Der (3 {m), (1), (o}
| .
Retal) (Mercantile) M bper 20 1) per 20 [33% ! per 40 Floor {1l (m], {n), {P}J
l
Waiting Rooms (Adrpons, A Toper 33 4 por 73 [50% Vper 200 |5 per 300 {03, [md (n). (p)
Railrcad ant Bus Statons) i ;

(19) Euneral Establishment Preparatiop Rooms. Funeral establishment Freparation rooms shall
comply with the provisions of 239 CMR 3.07.

3711405

{a) The preparation room of & Funeral establishment shzll be provided with a floor drain and
flooring that is compliant with 239 CMR 3.07(3

(b} The preparation room shall include a flushing rim sink

te protecied by proper backflow deviees.

{c) Anadditional reduced pressure zoné backfiow preventer shali be mstailed on the warer
distribution system to the building at the outlet side of the meier ormain control vajve,

(d) Emergency Wash Stations shall be ingtalled and be compiiant with the provisicns of
238 CME. '



Page I of 2

Edwin May

From: Shultz, Robert (DEP) [robert.shulz@state ma. us)
Sent:  Wednasday, Septembar 21, 2011 1:56 PM

To: Edwin May

Subject: RE: Asbestos remediation

OK -A total interior gut is just about the same thing. We refer to that as & “demolition/renovaticn
cperation™

DEMOLITION/RENOVATION, for the purpese of 310 CMR 7.15, means any operation which
involves the wrecking, teking out, removal, stripping, or altering in any way {including repairing,
restoring, drilling, cutfing, sanding, sawing, scratching, scraping, or digging into) or construction
of one or more facility components or facility component insulation. This term inciudes load

and nonload- supporting structural members of a facility.

They need to test everything that is coming out before they contaminate the whole place. {left a
meassage for the gentleman earlier today but have not heard back,

Iwill tet you know what | find out from DLS when she gets back on Friday. 'l be in tomorrow moming
but have to go fo Northfield for the afternocn.

~Boh-

GBob ety

Bob Shuliz

MassDEP

436 Dwight Street

Springfield, MA 01103
413-T55-2210 (office}
413-784-1148 (fax)

Robert. Shultz@state.ma.us {e-mail)

The information ransimitted is intended solely for the individual or entity to which it is addressed and may
contain confidential and/or privileged material. if you are not the intended recipient, please do not
retransmit or disseminate. If you beliave that you have received ihis email in error please contact me and
delate the material from your computer.

From: Edwin May [mailto:EMay@Townofgb.org)
Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2011 12:43 PM
To: Shuliz, Rebert (DEP)

Subject: RE: Asbestos remediation

We're not demolishing this structure, fust g "TOTAL GUT REHAB". k should have been demotishad rather
than repaired.

From: Shultz, Robert (DEP) I'mailio:robert. shuliz@state.ma.us)
Sent: Wednesday, September 21, 2011 11:43 AM

To: Edwin May

Subiect: RE: Asbestos remediation

Hi Ea.

72272011



FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

[F] TROUBLE SIGNAL. A signal initiated by the fire alarm
systern or devies indicative of 2 fault in 2 monitored cirenit or
component. -

[F] VISIBLE ALARM NOTIFICATION APPLIANCE. A
notification applience that alerts by the sense of sight.

{F] WET-CHEMICAL EXTINGUISHING SYSTEM. A
solution of water and potassium-carbonate-based chemical,
potassivm-acetate-based chemical or a combination thereof,
forming an extinguishing agent.

{F] WIRELESS PROTECTION SYSTEM. A sysiem or a
part of a sysiem that can fransmit and receive signals without
the aid of wire.

[F] ZONE. A defined area within the protected premises, A
zone can define an area from which a signal can be received, an
area Lo which a sigral cun be sent oy an arca in which a form of
conirol can be executed,

[F1 ZONE, NOTIFICATION. An ares within & bailding or
facility covered by potification appliances which are activated
simuitanecusiy,

SECTION 803
AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

¥] 903.1 General. Automaric sprinkler sysiems shail comply
with this section.

[F] 903.1.1 Aliernative protection. Alternative auiomatic
fire-extinguishing systems complying with Section 004
shall be permitted in lew of avtomatic sprinkler protection
where recognized by the applicable standard and approved
by the fire code official.

[F] %03.2 Where required. Approved auicmatic sprinkler sys-
fems in new buildings and structures shall be provided in the
locations described ip Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12,

Exception: Spaces or areas in telecommunications build-
ings used exclusively for telecommunications eguipment,
associated electrical power distribution squipment, batter-
ies and standby engines, provided those spaces or areas are
equipped threughout with an avtomatic smoke detecrion
system in accordance with Section 907.2 and are separated
from the remzinder of the building by not less than 1-hogr
Jire barriers constructed in accordance with Section 707 o
not less than 2-our horizontal assemblies consiructad in
accordance with Section 712, or hath,

[F1903.2.1 Group A. An automaiic sprinkler systent shall
be provided throughout buiidings and portions thereof used
ze Oroup A ccoupanciss as provided in this section. For
Croup A~1, A-2, A-3 and A-4 occupancies, the muomatic
sprinkler sysiem shall be provided throughout the floor area
where the Group A-1, A2, A3 or A2 ofcupancy is
focated, and in all floors from the Group A agcupancy 1o,
and inciuding, the nearest fevel of exir discharge serving the
Group A occupancy. For Group A-5 occupancies, the auio-
maic sprinkler jystem shall be provided in the spaces indi-
cated mn Secijon 903.2.1.5,

184

[F]1 903.2.1.1 Group A-L. An awomaric sprinkler sys-
tem shali be provided for Group A-? vccupancies where
~one of the following conditions exists:

L. The fire aren exceeds 12,000 square fest (1115
Comd): g

. The fireareqhas an occupant load of 300 or more;

2

- The fire area is Iocated on a fioor other than & level
of exit discharge serving such occupancles; or

(95

4. The fire areg contains a multitheater compiex.
[F1903.2.1.2 Group A-2. An curomatic sprinkler sys-
fern shall be provided for Group A-2 occupancies where
one of the foliowing conditions exists:

L. The fire area exceeds 5.000 square feet (464.5
m?);

[

. The fire area has an accupant load of 100 or more;
or

- The fire areq is focated on a floor othes than a Jevel
of exit discharge serving such otcupancies,

L2

1 903.2.1.3 Group A-3. Ap automaric sprinkier sys-
iem shall be provided for Group A-3 occupanciss where
one of the following conditions axists:

1. The fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115
i

=2

. The fire area has an eccupant load of 300 or more; ¢
or

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a leve!
of exit discharge serving such occu pancies,

[F] 903.2.1.4 Group A-4d. Au awomaric sprinkler sys-
tem shall be provided for Group A-4 occupancies where
one of the following conditions exists:

L. The fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115
wy;

2. The fire area has an occupant load of 300 of more;
or

3. The fire area is located on 2 floor other than a level
of exit discharge serving such occupancies.

[¥] 903.2.1.5 Group A-8. An quromanic sprinkler sys-
tem shall be provided for Group A-5 occupancies in the
foliowing areas: concession stands, retaj) areas, press
boxes and other accessory use areas in excess of 1,000
sguare feet {93 m?),

[F1643.2.2 Group B ambulatory health care facifities,
An aulomatic sprinkler sysiem shall be installed throughaut
ali fire areas containing a Group B ambulatory health care
facility ocoupancy when sither of the following conditions
EXISLE &t any {1me:
1. Four or more care recipients are incapable of seif-
preservalion, |
2. One or more care recipients who are incapable of self-
preservaton are located at ocher than the levef of exit
discharge gerving such an OCLUDERCY.

2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING coDE®



O B,

[F1903.2.3 Graup E. An awiomatic sprinider sveten shall
be provided for Group E oceupancies as follows:

1. Througheut all Group E fire areas greater than °

12,000 squars fer (1115 m® in area.

2. Througheut every portion of educations) butldings ~

below the Jowest leve! of exir discharge serving that
portion of the building. : ‘

Exception: An awromaric sprinkler system i not
required in any ares below the lowest Jevel af exit
discharge serving that area where every classroom
throughout the building has af least one exterior
exif door 2t ground level, ‘

iF¥] 903.2.4 Group ¥l An awromaric spriniler sysiem
shall be provided throughout all butldings containing a
Group F-1 occupancy where ane of the following condi-
tons exists:

LA Group a1 fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet
(1115 m™).

fa

A Group T-1 fire area is located more than three sto-
ries above grade plone.

- The combined area of all Group F-7 fire oreas on all
Aoors, including any mezzanines, exceeds 24000
square feer {2230 m?),

L

1] 903.2.4.1 Woodworking operations. An aurematic
sprinkier sysrem shall be provided throvghout ali Group
F-1 occupancy fire areas that contzin woodworking
operafions in excess of 2,500 square feet 1232 m?) in wreg
which generate finely divided combustible wase or use
finely divided combustible marerials.

[F]1993.2.5 Group H. Auromaric sprindler sysiems shall be
provided in high-hazard occupancies as required in Sec-
tiens 903.2.5.1 through 903.2.5.3,

[F1%03.2.5.1 General. An awromatic spiinkler system
shall be instalied in Group H occupancies.

IF] 943.2.5.2 Group H-3. An awomaric sprinkler gvs-
tem shall be installed throughout buildings containing
Group H-5 occupancies. The design of the sprinkier sys-
tem shall not be less than that required by this code for
the occupancy hazard classifications in accordance with
Table 903.2.5.2. Where the design area of the sprinkler
system consists of & corridor protected by one row of
sprinklers, the mazimum number of sprinklers required
1o be calculated s 13,
[F] TABLE 902.2.5.2
GROUP H-5 SPRINKLER DESIGN CRITERIA

OCEUPANCY HAZARD

LOCATION CLASBIFICATION

e

Fabrication aress Ordinary Hazard Group 2

Service cornidors Crdinary Harard Group 2

Storage rooms withent dispensin

1 Grdinary Hazard Group 2

53

Slorage rooms with dispensing Extra Hazard Groep 2

Carridars Ordingry Hazerd Group 2

2008 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING GODED

FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

[F] 903.2.5.3 Pyroxylin plastics, An auzomaric sprin-
kier systern shall be provided in butldings, or portons

- thereod, where cellujose ritate film or pyroxyhin plastics
are manufactured, stored or handled in quaniities
exceeding 100 pounds (45 kg, -

fFj 043.2.8 Group L An autamﬁr‘:ic sprinkier svstem shail

. be provided throughout buildings with & Group I fire area.

Exception: An cutomaic sprinfler sysiem installed i
accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 or 903.3.1.3 shall he
allowed in Group I facilites.

(F1903.2.7 Group M. A automatic sprinkler sysiem shatl
be provided thronghost buildings containing a Group M
occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

. A Group M fire area exceeds 12,000 Square fest
(115 m*):

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories
shove grade plane.

3. The combined arez of sl Group M fire areas on all

floors, mchuding any mezzanines, sxcesds 24,600
square feet (2230 m*).

L

- A Group M occupancy is used for the display and sale
of upholstered furniiure.

1] 963.2.7.1 High-piled storage. An auiomatic sprin-
kler svsiem shall be provided in accordance with the
dniernational Fire Code in all buildings of Group M
where storage of merchandise is in high-piled or rack
storage arrays.

(Bl 903.2.8 Group R. An awomaric sprinkler systen
instaliedin accordance with Section 903.3 shall be provided

throughout all bujldings with a Group R fire area,

[F1903.2.9 Group 8-1. An casomaric sprinkler svsiem shal)
be provided throughout all bulldimgs containing a Group
S-1 occupancy where one of the fellowing conditions
exjsls:

1. A Group S-1 fire area exceeds 12.000 square feet
{1115 m™.

2. A Groop S-1 fire area is located more than three sto-
ries above grude plane.

[

. The combined area of al] Group 5-1 fire areqs on all
floors, including any mezzanines. excesds 24,000
square feet (2236 m?%),

4. A Group 8-1 fire areq used for the storage of com-

mercial trucks or buses where the fire area excesds

5,000 square feet (464 m?),

(F1903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An auromanc spreindder
system shall be provided throughout all buildings used as
repar garages in aceordance with Section 406, as shown:

1. Buildings having two or more stories above grade

plare, including hasemerts, with a fire area con-
taning 2 repair garage exceeding 10,000 sguare
faet (G289 m™,

[}

. Buildings no more than one Stary above grode
plane, wilh a fire areo CONAINING a repair garage
exceeding 12,000 square feet (1115 me




TR0 CMER: STATE BOARD OF BUILDING REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS

9,00 continued

3. MNoncombustible and limited cambusﬁ'ti]a concealed spases and plenums that eontain
electiical, data, communications and other cables thai are of ‘h“ types and in the
configrations permitted in such spaces by 527 CMR 12.60: 2008 Massochusetts Electrical
Code {Amendmanis).
§. Transformer Vaults where all the fqllow1 np conditions are satisfled:
a. The cable within the vault is fiame retardant or Himited combustible,
b, The dielectric fluid iz a limited combustible fhid.
c. The vault it encicsed in three hour fire resistance rated construction.
d. The vault is af grade or no more than one level below grade, Access to the vault is
directly from the xterior or via a dedicated two hour passagewsy,
¢. The vault is protected with antomatic smoke detection connected to the building fir
alarm systern which notifies the fire department upon astivation,
£. 'The room ig limited to the sole use of the transformer equipment and is limited in size
to sccominodate sald equipment only. Storage is p‘rohibited in the vault cnclosure.
g The vault is provided with spill comtainment.
b An cmergescy fire plan has been developed with and approved by the fire
department.
i Continuous ventilation is provided for the veult enclosure in acsordance with the
ventilation requirements of NFPA 30,
1. The ventilation equipment is dedicated 0 serve the vaukt only,
k. Standby emergency power, in addition 1o the normal power source, iz provided for
the ventilation squipment.
1. The vault is no jarger in arce than 2400 sq. i
7. Transformer Vaults where an aliernative suppression svstek-_ is provided for the vaultin
accordance with Section 904 and Exception 6. conditions 1., 1., and k. ars met.

903.2.1 through 503.2.10 Replace these subsections with the Table 903.2:

TABLE %03.2 OCCUPANCY AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER REQUIREMENTS

{ Provide automatic fire sprinkler system throughout building if one of the |
o ] Iollowing condifions will exist (ee Notz a);
Building having occupaney - - 1 -
Building ageregate | Building oscupant o
i h Croeupancy located
i ) ares ioad
A-{ >0 s, £ =B Any level
. =50 Any fi her §i £ exi
42 [ightchib} 5,000 sq. fL. Y .rl)m' othy rfnan ley:e! af axit
discharge for A-2 Use
H
; i ather th e (it
-2 [other than Nightclab} »5.000 s, It =100 Ay fioor i . a0 lovel of exi
discharge for A-2 Use
Any fi ther than leve! of exit
43 25,000 5. ft L300 oy ijrc acri an level of ext
discharge for A-3 Use
’ % 1 i
A 57,500 54, . 2300 ARy ﬂf:cr ather than 1avri. of exit
discharge for A-4 Use
A-5 See Note b
; B >12,000 sq. £, | o I
i B [Ambulazory Health Care] Seoote ¢ i
E »12,000sq ft, | — |
E [below level of exit discharpe} See Note d
T T : : :
M i £5 & if
F 12,000 54, & E - | More than 3 stfm s sbove grade
i ] plang
Fet [Woodworking Operations) See Note e f
H >0 e, fL 4 >{ ; Any love]
Pyrowylin Plesiics Seg MNots f
I =0 s, fL | >0 Any level
; M [other than bullk merchandizing and 12 000 50, & ; More than 3 stories above grade
o upholstered forpiture display/sale] R plane

8/6/10 780 CMR. - Eightk Edition - 33



780G CMR: STATE BOARD OF BUILDING REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS

9.00; continusg

TABLE %03.2 GCCUPANCY AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER BEQUIREMENTS - continzed

|
|
|

Provide automatic fire sprinkler systam throughout building if one of the 4

) Tollowing conditions will exist {ee Note 1) ]
- Bniiding having occupancy — — ] 1
Building aggregate | Building BCUpRNT | } |
- Occupancy jocated i
area i load : I
M [buli: merchandising) >0 g0 i, =0 Any leve} i
M Papholstered furnitare displav/sale] >0 8, >0 Any level i
R >0 sg. fL - >y Any leve] I
More then 3 stories ahove grade |
51 >12,000 8. . € Huim < Stories above gradz |
plane ]

. . Maore thar 3 storles above grade

Se1 [with commercial trucks/haue storage >5,000 50, ft - : s
plene
8-1 [with repair garage, building more 16,000 sq. & In basement or more than 3 storisy
than 2 stories above grade} i a4 above orade plane
5-1 Iwith ir garage, building 1 sio
1 (it repair garage, bullding ) siory 12,000 5. £, In basemens
e shove grade] !
S-1 [with commercial imck/nus repair 1[ 5,000 5q. fL . In basernent or more than 2 stories
garaze) | above grade plane
5-1 Twith tire storage) Sex Nowe g
8-2 See Note i & Note |

Note o~ Far Use Group B and -1 Buildings with an agaregate buiiding ares of 12,000 sq. £, or more, and Mixed ‘g
Use Buikiings, the sprinkier system shalf ko designed and istalied fhroughout the strucwme in gecordanes with i
FFPA 13 For the pirpeses of saction $03.2, the aggrepaie building area shell b the combined are of all stories of I
the building and fire walls shail not be considered to create separate buildings. Buildings of entirs R-Use, other than
R-1 Ocoupznceies and R-2 Dormitaries, having no more than three dwelling units and alse less than 12,000 agErepniat
4. £ shall be permitted 16 have a1 astomatic fire suppression system. installed in accordence with section 904.3.1.3,1
provided that every automaric sprinkier svetem shall have g least one automatic water supply or & stored warer
supply source in aceordance with NFPA-13D where the minimum quantity of siored water chall equal the water
demand rale Himes 20 meinnles. Townhouses are Tequired to be profected by awomaric sprivkler systems,
Mote b - Gronp A-5, An mtomatio sprinkler sysiem shall be provided in concession stands, retail areas, press boxes
and oiher 8CCessory nse arsas i excess of 100G sguare feel {93 nf).
Note ¢ - Group B ambularory health care facilities. An eriomatic sprinkier systom shall be instalied throughout el
fire areas containing « Group B ambulatory health care facility occupancy when sither of e following conditions
ex1sts al any time:
1. Four oy more care recipients are ncepabic of self-preservation,
2. One or more care recipients who are incapable of self-preservation are located at other than the Jevel }
of ot discharge serving such en QCLUPARCY.
Note d - Group E. An austomatic sprinkier system shall be instalied throughant every porsion of educarional
buildings bejow the lowsstJevel of exit discharge serving that portion of the building.
Note e~ Group F [Weodworking Operations}, An automatic sprinkler gystem shall be installed throughout buiidings
where there is a wootdworking operation in sxcess of 2,500 square feet (232 of) in area that genermies finely divided |
combustilie wasts or uses finely divided combusibie materials.
Note T~ Pyroxylin Plastics. An automaric rprinkler spstam shall be provided in buildings, or pertions thercof, where
cellulose niwate film or pyroxylin plastics are manufactered, stored or handled in quantities exceeding 100 ponnds 1
(45 k). -
Note g - Bulk storage of tires. An awtomaric sprinkier spriem shall be provided thron hout buildings and structures ;
l
|

R

where the area {or the storage of tires exceeds 20,000 cubic feet {566 nry,

Motz b - Group $-2, 4n awomatic Sprinkler systen shall be provided for Group 8-2 oocupancies as follows: 1,
Throughout buildings classifisd as Group §-2 Bnclosed Parking. 2. Throughout Group 8-2 Enclosed Parking located
beneath other groups.

Note I~ Comnmercial Parking Garages, An awtomaric sprinkler susten: shell be provided throughout buildings having

storage of commertial trocks or buses where the aggregate floor area used for pariing exceeds 5,060 square feet (464
N
mo.

B/AA10 780 CMR - Eighth Edition - 5



R )

780 CME: STATE BOARD OF BUILDING REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS

34.08: continued

302.3 After the first sentence, add this sentence:

The cumulative effect of the load increase since sriginaf construction shail he considered,
it}S.:’. Replace the text with "See 780 CMR Appendix G,
303.3 After the first sentence, add this sentence:

The cumulative effect of the load incrzase since original construction shall be corsidersd,
3034 Replace the first occurrence of the word Swith” with the word “where”,

383.6 Replace as follows:

303.6 Means of Egress Capacity Factors, For means of egress capacity refer fo section
102221

364.5 Replace the text with ‘See 780 CMR Appendix G
305.1 Add a second sentence as follows:

Existing fire escapes chall compiy with the testing and certification requirements of section
162.2.2.4,

307.6,307.7, and 367.9 Deicte these sobseciinns,
3101 Replace as follpws:
310.1 Seope. Accessibility requirements shall be in accordance with 57} CMR,
312 to 310.9 Delete these sectione.
485.1: Add te the end of the first sentence, this pitrase:

“and where required by a change of occupancy classification in accordance with section
g12.1.17

803.2 Add subsection:

503.2 Major Alterations. Automatic sprinkier systems may be required in buildings
undergaing major alterations per section 102.2.1.1

584.1 Replacs as fallows:

504.1 General Repairs shail be done in o manner that maintaing the level of protection
provided for the means of egress, and in accordance with section 102,221,

545.1 Replace this subsection:
H03.1 General. Accessibility requirement shall be in accordance with 521 CMR.
547 and 509 Delete these section,

603.2 Add section:

603.2 Major Alterations. Inaddition to the requirement in section 603 automatic sprinkler
systetns may be required in buildings undergoing major alterations per section 102.2.1.1

604.7 Replase this section:

604.1 General, Alterations shall be done in a manner that maintains the level of protection
provided for the means of egress, and in accordance with section 102.2.7, i

6051 through 605.1.14 Replace a5 follows:

605.1 General, Accessibility requirements shail be in aceordance with $21 OB, Eievator
and platform L installation raquirements are per 324 CMR,

603.2 Delete.

§06.2 Replace ‘reprocfing’ with ‘rercofing’

BI6/50 180 CMR - Bighth Edition - 13%




780 CMR: STATE BOARD OF BUILDING REGULATIONS AND STANDARDS

34.00; continued

181.5,4.2 Add these exceptions to Jem |
Exceptions; : -

1. The International Building Code 2009 with Massachugetts Amendments using 50%

of preseribed forces when direcied here by sections 807.4.3 o

<. The International Building Code 2009 with Massachusetts Amendments using
&. 30 % of preseribed forces when dirested hers by Section 1003.3.) and when the
vertical addition increasss the building area less than o equal to 30%.
b, 75% of presuribed forces when dirscted here by section 100331 and when the
vertical addition intreases the building area more than 30% but less than 50%.

101.9 Add subsection:

101.9 Cumulative Effects of Alterations, Additiens, or Changes nf Occupancy on
Structural Blements, As noted in several sections of this code, evaluation of strucmral
elements and their connections shall consider the cumulative effects of alterations, additions,
oT ehanges of oocupancy singe criginal construction, Altrations, additons, or changes in
oceupancy that meet all of the following criteria, are exempt from consideration of
cumnlative effzcts on structural elements:
L. Structural work doss not involve more thap 2% of the total tributary area of
harizontal framing members of any exigting framed floor or roaf,
2. Swucrural work dess not alter shear walls above the foundation,
3. Structural work does not alter columns or dizgonal braces,
4. Biructural work does not create an opening in any framed floor ar roof that has an
area more than 2% of the framed floor or roof,
8. Swuctural work does not alter any fioor or rocf dizphragm and it connections such
that in-plunc shear resistance is reduced by mors than 5%,
6. Structural work does not remove or reconfigure latera) load resisting frames, or
foundations supporting them.

181,19 Add subsection:

101,16 Masonry Walls. For alterations o buildings with masonry walls, all masonry walls
shall comply with the provisions of Appendiz Al as modified by Massachusetrs
Amendments, where any of the following conditions exist:

L. the work ares exceeds 56% of the aggregate ares of the building, ar

2. an occupansy increase of more than 25% and to a total of 160 or more, or

3. achange of occupancy to a relative hazard category of T or 2 per Table $12.5, or

sducational acoupancies K to 12, or

4. 2 Level 2 Alteration, as defined by section 404, o zn Oceupancy Category IV per

ABCE T,

102.2 Replace as follows:

102.2 Other Laws and Speciaity Codes. The provisions of this code shall not be deemed
to nullify any provisions of local, state, or federal law, or the regulations purkuant to specialty
codes listed in section 101.4 of the Jarernational Building Code 2009 with Massachuserts
Amendments {780 CMR 101.4),

102.2.1 Add subsection:
102.2.1 Fire Protectisn Systems. Notwithstanding other provisions of this code, the
requitemnents of this section are applicable in existing buildings. in case of conflict, between
regulations of 780 CMR, the more restrictive reguirement applies.

102.2.1.1 Add subsection:
F02.2.1.1 Major Alterations. When existing buildings or portions thereofundergo additions
or alterations, M.G.L. ¢. 148, § 260 may apply with respect to automatic sprinkier
requirements. The requirements of this statte are enforced by the fire official. Agplicability

of fhese requirements cen be found at the Department of Fire Services web gite
Wy nlass wov/dfs,

B/5/10 T80 CMR - Eighth Edition - 136

34,

B85



521 CMR: ARCHITECTURAL ACCESS BOARD

32 CMR 3.00: FURISDICTION

31 SCOPE
Allwork performed on public buildings or facilities (see 521 CMR 5.00: DEFINITIONS), inciuding
construction, reconstruttion, alierations, remodeling, additions, and chan ges of ure shall conform to
521 CMR.

3.1.1 To determine the scope of compliance, refer to 521 CMR 3.2, New Construction and 521 CMR 3.3,
Existing Buildings. In the absence of jurisdiction by 521 CMR, 780 CMR: the State Building Cade
- may apply.

3.2 NEW CONSTROUCTION
All new construction of public buildings/fucilities shall comply fully with 521 CMR.

3.3 EXISTING BUILDINGS
All additions (o, reconsiruction, remodeling, and alterations or repairs of existing public buildings
or facilities, which require a bailding permit or which are so defined by a state or local inspector, shall
be govemed by all applicable subsecticns in 521 CMR 2.00: JURISDICTION,

For specific applicability of 521 CMR to existing muitiple dwellin gs undergoing renovations, see
521 CMR %.2.1.

3.2.1 If the work being performed amounss to less than 30% of the Jull and fair cash value of the huilding
and

& if the work costs less than $300,000, then only the work being performed is required to comply

with 521 CMR
ar :

b, if the work costs $100,000 or more, then the work being perfermed is required to comply with
521 CMR. In addition, an accessible public entrance and an accessibly toflet roem, telephone,
drinking fountain (if tollets, telephones and drinking fountaing are provided) shall also be
provided in compliance with 521 CMR.

Exception: General maintenance and on-going upkeep of existing, underground transit facilities
will pol wrigger the requirement for an accessible entrance and toilet uniess the cost of the work
exeeeds $500,000 or unless work is being performed on the entrance or woilel,

Exception: Whether perforraed alone or in combination with each other, the following types of
alferations ave not subject to 521 UMR. 2.3.1, unless the cost of the work cxcesds £500,000 or
uniess work is being performed on the entrance or toilet, (When performing excmpted work, o
memo stating the exempted work and its costs must be THed with the permit application or a
separate building permit must be obtnined,)

L a. Curb Cuts: The construction of curb cuts shall comply with 521 OMR 21.00: CURB
- CUTS,

' b Afteration work whick is limited solely to elecirical mechanical, or phimbing systems:
to abatement of hazardous tnaterials; or retrofit of asomatic sprinklers and doss not
invelve the aiferation of any elements or spaces reguived fo be accessible ander
521 CMR. Where electrical ontlets and controls are aliered, they must comply with

521 CMR,

c. Reof repair or replacement, window repair orreplacement, repointing and masonry repair
work,

d Work relating to septic system repairs, {including Tile V, 310 OMR 15,00,

... improvements) site ut

3.3.2 Hthe work performed, including the exermpred work, amounts to 20% or more of the full and fair cash
value (see 521 CMR .38 of the bullding the entire building is required to comply with 527 CME.

206 ' 521 CMR - 3



336

3.4

A6

(¥3]
N
et

otherwise calculate the jull and Jair cash v

521 CMR: ARCHITECTURAL ACCESS BOARD

continved

& Where the cost of constructing an addition to & building amounts to 30% or more of the full ond
Jair cash vaiue of the existing building, both the addirion and the existin & Building must be fully
accessible,

Alterations by a tenant do net trigger the requirements of 521 CMR 3.3.15 and 3.3.2 for other tenznts,
However, alserations, reconstruction, remodeling, repairs, construction, snd changes in use falling
within 521 CMR 3.3.1b and 3.3.2, will trigger compliance with 521 CMR in arcas of public use, for
the owner of the building.

No alteration shall be undertaken which decreases or has the. effect of decreasing accessibility or
usability of a building or faciiity below the requirements for new congstraction.

¥ airerations of single elements, when considered fo gether, amournt to an alteration of a room or space
m 2 building or facility, that space shall be made accessible,

No alieration of an existing element, space, or atea of a bullding or facility shall impose a requirerment
for greater acceseibility than that which would be required for new construction.

CHANGE IN USE

When the vse of a bulding changes from a private use 10 one that is eper o wnd used by the public,
an accessible entrance must be provided, even if no work is being performed. When 2 portion of
budlding changes use from a private use to one that is open 19 an used by the public, then an accessible
route must be provided from an accessible entrance even if no work is being performed,

RESERVED FOR FUTURE ACTION: Changes in use, from private to public, in private residential
homies wherte no work is being performed,

WORK PERFORMED OVER TIME .

When the work performed on a building is divided into separate phases or pProjects of is under separate
buflding permits, the total cost of such work in ary 36 month period shall he added together in
applying 521 CMR 3.3, Hxisting Buildings. '

MULTIPLE USES
When a building is oceupied by two or more uses, the Regulations which apoly to each use shall apply
to such pans of the building within that use,

521 CMR 3.3, Existing Buildings shall zpply based upon each wre and not on the entire building,

Example: If a three story building valued at $300,000 has ene floar of retall wse and two floors of
residential use, the full and fair cosh value of e retail portion shall be ¥ of the total value which
would he $100,000.

PARTIAL APPLICATION
When only a portion of 2 building is subject 0 521 CMR, the full and fuir cosh value shall be prorated
by the ratio of the square foctage of that portion to the sguare footage of the whole building,

Example: Where the whole butlding is 100,000 square feet, the Jull and fair cash value is § 1,000,000,
and the part subject to 521 CMR s 10,000 square feet {one-tenth of the total), then the fudl and fair
cash value of the part subject to 521 CMR would be ane-tenth of $1,800,000 or $100,000,

I the Board defermines that such proration weuld cause an inequitable result, the Board may
[ the partd

OUTDOOR FACILITIES

For factlities where the primary function areas are outdoors, inchuding but not lmited to beaches,
parks, pienic areas, playerounds. and campshes, the full and fair cash value shall include the value of
the land as well ws any buddings ar fueilities on the land.

V275006 : SZICMR -8




3.10

311

3.2

S21CMR: ARCHITECTURAL ACCESS BOARD

continued

HISTORIC BUILDINGS

An historic building or facility that is listed or is eligible for listing fn the Nationz! or State Regisier
of Historic Places or is destgnated as historic under appropriate state or focal laws may be granted a
variance vy the Board to allow alternate accessibility, ¥ & variance ig requested on the basis of
historical significance, then consultation with the Massachusetts Historical Comuission is required
in order to determine whether a building or facility is eligible for listing or Iisted in the Nalional or
State Register of Historic Places. The Massachusetts Historical Comunission may reguest a copy of
the proposed variance request and supporting documentation to substantiate the variance request and
its effect on historic resources. A written statement from the Massachusetts Historical Commission
isTequired with the application for variance. ‘

TEMPORARY STRUCTURES :

Ternporary buildings or facilities, includin g hut not limited to reviewing stands, temporary classronims,
bieacher areas, exhibit areas, temporary banking {acilities, temporary health screening servicss, or
temporary pedestrian passageways around a construction sire, shall comply with 521 CMR, Stmetures,
sites and equipment directly associated with the actpal processes of consiruction, such as scaffolding,
bridging, materials hoists, or construction wailers, need not apply. '

SECURITY STRUCTURES
Accessibility is not required to observation galleries nsed prirmarily for security purposes.

NON-OCCUPIABLY SPACES :

Spaces accessed only by ladders, catwalks, crawl spaces, or freight {non-passenger) elevators, and
frequented only by service personnel for repair purposes, are exempl. Such spaces may include, but
are not Hndted to, elevator pils, clevator penthouses, Ppiping or equipment catwalks.

127106 521 CMR-9



Edwin A. May
Inspector of Buildings

Telephone: (413) 528-3206
Fax: {413} 5283064

TOWN OF GREAT BARRINGTON
MASSACHUSETTS

REPORT OF BUILDING INSPECTION

BSPECTION TYPE:, 304 106 COMPLAINT PAYMENTDUE §
! OWNER / OCCUPANT, i
INSPECTION ADDRESS;
RESPONSIBLE PARTY: TRLEPHONE: o
DATE: . INSPECTOR: &
BUILDING CONST TYPE__ . USEGROWP___ QCCUPANT LOAD {
— S S if
SAFETY COMPONENT 780 C MR COMMENTS (6/ @
0 NUMBER OF EXTTS PER FLOOR 101871021 Gb(f
03 ENCLOSEN EXIT STAIRS/ WIDTH 009 L, i}f
D EGRESS LIGHTING/ EXIT DISCHARGE LO08.1/1006.3 g_u )i
O EXIT SIGNS (ILLUM) EMERG. BACE-UP 10112 g! " - )
01 BOILER / FURNACE ENCLOSURE T-302.1.1 i e({_ ., ]I i
1 PENETRATIONS-STARFLOOR/WALL/CEILING 712 L cw/l T
Tl UNOBSTRUCTED EGRESS 1003.6 ¢ - Ak
T EMERGENCY ESCAPE WINDOW (SLESP RGOM) 1025 ! . _ .
O PIRE EXTINGUISHERS MAINTAINED ey K77 . )
O SUPPRESSION SYSTEM MATNTAINED 903 i . A
O KITCHEMN HOOD SUPPRESSION MAINTAINED 9042, 1/904 11 _ﬁ /i i 7.
0 SMOKE / HEAT / CARBON MONOXIDE 507 R L . ,Sy, > ,ﬁ "2
O MANUALL PULLS PRESENT /MAINTANED 907.3 i Y {/ j’//
T EGRESS WIDTH DOORMAMPICORRIDOR L00K.1/10105.173016.2 e P
£ HAND + GUARDRAILS PRESENT/MAINTAINED 100y _f' }f&) .
O LOCKS AND LATCHMNG SYSTEM(S) 1008 2y g e
0 FIRESMOKE DeosthERS PRESENT/MAINTAINED 716, 207165 ‘
0O USEGROU @AN[G HARDWARE 1003.1.0 : 'MA Rz
) . ASSEMBLY'AISLES/ WIDTH g .7
DO EXTERIGR STAIRCASES INSPECTED BY PE. | 106133 M
O CERTIFICATE OF INSPECTION POSTED 195.5 A
b

OTHER

AAR ISSUES SIGNAGE BTC, 11010 EE + g

ORDER: [N COMPLIANCE WITH 7 Edition 780 CODE OF MASSACHUSETTS REGULATIONS [OMR) YOU ARE MIERERY
ORDERED TO ABATE OR CORRECT THE CONDITIONNS ENUMERAT B ABOVE

BY.

SO ORDERED BY INSPECTOR, TITLE:

OK TO CERTIFY: T

HIS PREMESIS HAS BEEN FOUND TO BE N COMPLIANCE WITH 7" Edinon 780 CME, SECTION 108,

PROPERTY MAINTENANCE AND IS HERERY CERTIVIED BY:

INSPECTOR: HITLE:
REMIT PAYMENT TO: TOWN OF GREAT BARRINGTON

334 MAIN STREET
GREAT BARRINGTON, MA 01730



